
1

0123456789

CITY OFVENTURA 

f\DMINISTRATIYE REPORT 
Date: 

Agenda Item No.: 

Council Action Date: 

To: MAYOR AND COUNCILMEMBERS 

From: MABI COVARRUBIAS PLISKY, MMC, CITY CLERK 

Subject: 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARD CODES 

RECOMMENDATION 

December 1,2010 

8 

December 6, 2010 

Waive the second reading in full and adopt ordinances approving by reference the 2010 
Edition of the California Building Code, Electrical Code, Fire Code, Mechanical Code, 
Plumbing Code, and Residential Code, and amending certain provisions thereof through 
express findings of local necessity. 

DISCUSSION 

Attached for your reference is the proposed ordinance introduced by the City Council on 
November 15,2010. 

Mabi Covarrubias Plisky, 
City Clerk 



2

THIS PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 



3

ORDINANCE NO. 2010-_ 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 
2010 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 
AND AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIONS THEREOF 
THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL NECESSITY 

The Council of the City of San Buenaventura does ordain as follows: 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS. The City Council finds that certain local climatic, geological, or 
topographical conditions exist as follows: 

A. Climatic. The City experiences periods of high temperatures accompanied 
by low humidity and high winds each year. These conditions could create an 
environment in which the fire department may have great difficulty in controlling 
fires occurring in hillside brush areas as well as structures not having built-in fire 
protection. The City also experiences periods of intense rainfall, which create the 
need for special drainage precautions. 

B. Geological. The City is located in an area with expansive soils and 
includes hillsides that are subject to mudflows and unstable conditions. Special 
foundation considerations and soils analyses requirements must be in place to 
provide a reasonable degree of structural integrity for buildings constructed in 
these areas. Several earthquake faults run through the City that, when active, 
will impose unique lateral loads on structures in the City. Special lateral 
structural design criteria are needed to resist these lateral loads imposed by 
active earthquake faults in the City. 

C. Topographical. The City has hillside and flat land developments that 
require special drainage precautions, as well as a system of roadways and 
highways that generate traffic noise. Structures would be subject to water 
damage without special requirements addressing site drainage. 

D. After due consideration, the City Council finds and determines that these 
local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions make modifications and 
changes to the 2010 Edition of the California Building Code reasonably 
necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of life, health, and 
property. 

SECTION 2: Chapter 12.115 of Division 12 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code 
("SBMe") is amended in its entirety to read as follows: 

Building Standards 

Section 12.115.010. Adoption of California Building Code, 2010 Edition. 

A10-00281 1 



4

Pursuant to California Government Code sections 50022.1 to 50022.8, inclusive, 
Part 2 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, known as the California Building 
Code, 2010 Edition ("CBC"), including all standard printed Chapters and Sections 
(whether adopted by the State matrix or not), including Appendix Chapter H, is adopted 
by reference subject to the amendments, additions, and deletions set forth in this 
chapter. This Chapter is also intended to supersede SBMC sections 12.115 in its 
entirety. The CBC will apply to all occupancies identified by this code. One true copy of 
the CSC is on file in the office of the City Clerk and Building Official and is available for 
public inspection as required by law. 

Section 12.115.020. Amendments. 

A. The city council finds that certain local climatic, geological, and/or 
topographical conditions exist as follows: 

1. Climatic. The City experiences periods of high temperatures 
accompanied by low humidity and high winds each year. These 
conditions could create an environment in which the fire department 
may have great difficulty in controlling fires occurring in hillside brush 
areas as well as structures not having built-in fire protection. The city 
also experiences periods of intense rainfall, which create the need for 
special drainage precautions. 

2. Geological. The City is located in an area with expansive soils and 
includes hillsides that are subject to mudflows and unstable conditions. 
Special foundation considerations and soils analyses requirements 
must be in place to provide a reasonable degree of structural integrity 
for buildings constructed in these areas. Several earthquake faults run 
through the City that, when active, will impose unique lateral loads on 
structures in the City. Special lateral structural design criteria are 
needed to resist these lateral loads imposed by active earthquake 
faults in the City. 

3. Topographical. The City has hillside and flat land developments that 
require special drainage precautions, as well as a system of roadways 
and highways that generate traffic noise. Structures would be subject 
to water damage without special requirements addressing site 
drainage. 

B. After due consideration, the city council finds and determines that these 
local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions make modifications and 
changes to the CBC reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective 
protection of life, health, and property. The CBC is therefore modified, amended, 
added to, and changed as set forth below: 

A10-00281 2 



5

1. Chapter 1, Section 101.4.4, is amended to read as follows: 

101.4.4 Property Maintenance. The provisions of the most recently 
adopted Ventura City Property Maintenance Code (Article 6 of Chapter 
12.310 of Division 12 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code, as 
amended) shall apply to existing structures and premises; equipment 
and facilities; light, ventilation, space heating, sanitation, life and fire 
safety hazards; responsibilities of owners, operators, and occupants; 
and occupancy of existing premises and structures. 

2. Section 103.3 is amended to read as follows: 

103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction 
and with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the Building Official shall 
have the authority to appoint a Deputy Building Official, the related technical 
officers, inspectors, plan examiners and other employees. Such employees shall 
have powers as delegated by the Building Official. For the maintenance of 
existing properties, see the Ventura City Property Maintenance Code and 
Chapter 34 of this code. 

3. Section 104.S is amended to read as follows: 

104.5 Identification. The Building Official, and his/her representatives, shall carry 
and display, in a readily visible location, City identification that shows the City, 
Department, Division, employee name, and employee rank at all times while 
conducting City business. 

4. Section 105.2 Item 1 is amended as follows: 

1) A one-story detached accessory building used as a tool and/or storage 
shed, playhouse or similar use, provided it meets the following: 
a. 120 sq. ft. maximum floor area. 
b. 8 feet maximum top plate height. 
c. 4: 12 maximum pitch roof. 
d. Has no regulated plumbing or electrical or mechanical equipment. 
e. Is located in a residential zone. 
f. No more than one such structure per lot. 

5. Section 1 OS. 2 Item 2 is amended as follows: 

A10-00281 

2) Residential fences of wood, chain link or similar materials that are not 
more than 6 foot in height from grade as defined in this code. 

3 



6

6. Section 105.2 Item 6 is amended as follows: 

1. Residential sidewalks and residential driveways not more than 30 inches 
. above grade and not over any basement or story, and not part of a required Accessible 

Route of Travel as defined in this code. 

7. Section 105.2 Item 14 is added as follows: 

14) Outdoor Food and Produce Vendor stands, but only if such stands 
are limited as follows: 

a. 120 sq. ft. maximum floor area. 
b. 8 feet maximum top plate height. 
c. 4: 12 maximum pitch roof. 
d. Has no regulated plumbing or electrical or mechanical equipment. 
e. No more than one such structure per parcel. 
f. Is not used for mobile food processing, vending or sales 

8. Section 105.2 Electrical: is amended to read as follows: 

Repairs and Maintenance 

The replacement of lamps or the connection of approved portable electrical 
equipment to approved permanently installed electrical receptacles. 

Radio and Television Transmission 

Equipment used to transmit radio or television signals provided that such 
equipment does not exceed the structural loads of the structure to support such 
equipment. Electrical power supply equipment serving such transmission 
equipment is regulated and requires permits. 

9. Section 105.2 Gas: Item 2 is amended to read as follows: 

2) Repair of gas powered equipment that does not alter the listed 
approval of the gas equipment and does not create an unsafe 
condition. 

10. Section 105.2 Mechanical: Item 5 is amended to read as follows: 

5) Repair of mechanical equipment that does not alter the listed 
approval of the equipment and does not create an unsafe condition. 

11. Section 105.2 Mechanical: Item 7 is amended to read as follows: 

7) Nationally listed plug and cord, self-contained, refrigeration systems 
of 1 horsepower or less. 

A10-00281 4 



7

12, Section 105.2. 1 is amended to read as follows: 

105.2.1 In emergency situations, where emergency equipment replacement or 
repair must be performed, the person who performs the emergency work shall 
make permit application for the emergency work within one working business day 
following the emergency replacement or repair. 

13. Section 105.3 Item 4 is amended to read as follows: 

4) Be accompanied by construction documents, fees, and other 
information as required by sections 108 and 109 of this code. 

14. Section 105.3 Item 8 is added to read as follows: 

8) Have obtained Planning Division approval to make application for 
building permit. 

15. Section 105.3 Item 9 is added to read as follows: 

9) Be filed by appropriate state-licensed contractors or their authorized 
representatives, except for work on 1-2 unit dwellings, including 
structures accessory thereto, which may be filed by owner builders 
when approved by the Building Official. 

16. Section 105.5 is amended to read as follows: 

105.5 Expiration Of Permit. Every permit issued by the Building Official under the 
provisions of this Code will expire by limitation and become null and void, if the building 
or work authorized by such permit is not commenced: 

a. within six (6) months after the date such permit was issued, or 
b. if the building or work authorized by such permit is suspended or 

abandoned at any time after the work is commenced for a period of six 
(6) months, or 

c. if the work authorized by such permit does not receive final inspection 
approval within three (3) years from the date the permit was issued, or 

d. if the abatement deadline prescribed by the City's Code Enforcement 
section has passed. 

Before such work may be recommenced, a new permit will first be obtained to do 
so. The fee therefore, will be based upon the extent of work remaining to complete the 
project, but such fee will not exceed one-half the current permit fee providing no 
changes have been made or  will be made in  the original plan and specifications for such 
work; and provided further that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one 
(1) year. In order to renew action on a permit after expiration exceeds one year, the 
permittee will pay a new full permit fee. When the permittee is unable to perform work 
within the time required by this section, for good cause shown, any permittee holding an 

A10-00281 5 



8

unexpired permit may apply for an extension of the time within which the permittee may 
perform work under that permit. The Building Official may, without requiring payment of 
an additional permit fee, extend the time for action by the permittee for periods not 
exceeding six (6) months upon written request by the permittee showing that 
circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented action from being 
taken. For purposes of this Section, the time period during which a project is deemed 
suspended or abandoned will be measured as elapsed time between a pproved 
REQUIRED INSPECTIONS as delineated in this code. 

17. Section 109.6 is amended to read as follows: 

109.6 Fee Refunds. The Building Official may authorize refunding of a fee paid 
hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. 

The Building Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the 
permit fee when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this 
code. 

The Building Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the 
Plan Check Deposit fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan check 
deposit has been paid is withdrawn or cancelled before any examination time has been 
expended. 

The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except 
upon written application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the 
date of the fee payment. 

18. Section 109.7 is added and reads as follows: 

109.7 Fees. fees will be as established by city council resolution or ordinance. 
The city council will hold a public hearing upon notice on the resolution or on any 
proposed amendments thereto. The resolution or any amendment thereto will take 
effect on the date approved by city council adoption. 

19. Section 113 is amended to read as follows: 

A10�00281 

1. Section A 112 is amended to read as follows: 
A 112. Local Appeals Board. A Local Appeals Board (also identified as 
II Board II or IIBoard of Appeals") is established to hear and decide appeals 
of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the Building Official or 
Fire Marshal relative to the application and interpretation of the building 
requirements of the city. The Board will consist of seven members who 
will be appointed by the city council. In addition, the Building Official, or his 
or her designee, will be an ex-officio member and will act as secretary to 
the Board. Five of the voting members will constitute a quorum; the ex­
officio member will have no vote. Each of the voting members will be 

6 



9

qualified by experience and training to consider matters pertaining to 
construction regulations and each will be an actual resident of the City 
during his/her incumbency. Whenever possible, the Board will be 
composed of members representing the following specialties: General 
Contractor, Licensed Professional Engineer, Licensed Architect, 
Handicapped Accessibility Advocate, Planning/Zoning Professional, 
Licensed Real Estate Professional. If a Board member ceases at any time 
to be an actual resident of the City, the office held by that member will be 
deemed vacant. Of the members of the Board first appointed, three will 
be appointed for initial terms of four years. Their successors will be 
appointed for terms of four years. Each member will serve until his or her 
successor is appointed. The Board will adopt reasonable rules and 
regulations for conducting its business and will render all decisions and 
findings in writing to the appellant with a copy to the Building Official. The 
Board may recommend to the city council such new legislation as it may 
deem appropriate. The Local Appeals Board will serve as the appellate 
board or body whenever any of the codes adopted by reference provide 
for same. The Local Appeals Board will also act as the Appeals Board for 
the Earthquake Hazard Reduction Ordinance. Appeals to the Board will 
be processed in accordance with administrative policies and on 
application forms provided by the Building Official. A fee established by 
city council resolution will accompany an application for a hearing before 
the Board of Appeals. Copies of any rules and regulations adopted by the 
Board will be delivered to the Building Official, who will make them freely 
accessible to the public. The Board of Appeals will have no authority 
relative to interpretation of the administrative provisions of this code nor 
will the Board be empowered to waive requirements of this code or the 
technical codes. 

2. Section 114.5 is added to read as follows: 

114.5 Notice of Non-Compliance. Whenever the Building Official determines that 
work has been done on, over, or in any property in the City of San Buenaventura 
without the required permit, or has otherwise not been completed in accordance with 
the State Building Standards as adopted by the City of San Buenaventura, the Building 
Official may record a Notice of Non-Compliance for the subject property with the County 
Recorder after notifying the subject property owner of record, in writing, at least 30-days 
prior to recording. The Notice of Non-Compliance shall describe the property, set forth 
the non-compliance conditions, and shall identify the property owner given notice and 
that owners mailing address from the currently available County tax roll. 

The Building Official shall submit a Release of Non-Compliance to the County 
Recorder when it is determined that non-compliant conditions have been completely 
corrected in accordance with the City Municipal Code and all other local, state, and 
federal regulations. A fee, established by City Council, may be charged to the property 
owner for the preparation of the Release of Non-Compliance document. Payment of 

A10-00281 7 



10

I 
I 

this fee and all other fees associated with the enforcement case are prerequisites to 
delivery of the Release of Non-Compliance to the property owner. The Building Official 
may, at his/her discretion, enter into a written agreement with buyers of a Noticed 
property such that a Release of Non-Compliance is issued for a specific period of time 
in order to facilitate the purchase of the property and abatement of the violations. In 
these situations, payment of all other fees associated with the enforcement case may 
follow issuance of the Release of Non-Compliance. 

3. Section 116 is amended to read as follows: 

116 Refer to the most recently adopted Ventura City Property Maintenance 
Code. 

22. Section 117 is added to read as follows: 

117. Conflicts with other City Codes and Ordinances. When a conflict exists 
between City Planning and Zoning regulations and this section, the City Planning and 
Zoning regulations will take precedence. 

23. Section 118 is added to the CBC to read as follows: 

118. Fire District. Fire-resistive and fire preventative construction requirements 
specific to development within the urban wildland interface shall be in accordance with 
the State Fire Code as adopted by the City's Fire Marshal. 

24. Table 1505.1 is amended to read as follows: 

IA I IA 
B I B 

TABLE 1505.1a 
MINIMUM ROOF COVERING CLASSIFICATION 

FOR TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION 
IIA liB lilA IIiB IV 
B B B B B 

VA I VB 
B I B 

a. Unless otherwise required in accordance with Chapter 7 A of the this Code or required by the City Fire 
Code. 

25. Section 1613.8 is added to read as follows: 

1613.8 Seismic Design Provisions for Hillside Buildings. 

1613.8.1 Purpose. The purpose of this section is to establish minimum 
regulations for the design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing 
buildings when constructing such buildings on or into slopes steeper than one unit 
vertical in three units horizontal (33.3%). These regulations establish minimum 
standards for seismic force resistance to reduce the risk of injury or loss of life in the 
event of earthquakes. 

A10-00281 8 



11

1613.8.2 Scope. The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of the 
lateral-force-resisting system for hillside buildings at and below the base level 
diaphragm. The design of the lateral-foree-resisting system above the base level 
diaphragm shall be in accordance with the provisions for seismic and wind design as 
required elsewhere in this division. 

EXCEPTION: Non-habitable accessory buildings and decks not supporting or 
supported from the main building are exempt from these regulations. 

1613.8.3 Definitions. For the purposes of this section certain terms are defined 
as follows: 

BASE LEVEL DIAPHRAGM is the floor at, or closest to, the top of the highest 
level of the foundation. 

DIAPHRAGM ANCHORS are assemblies that connect a diaphragm to the 
adjacent foundation at the uphill diaphragm edge. 

DOWNHILL 01 RECTION is the descending direction of the slope approximately 
perpendicular to the slope contours. 

FOUNDATION is concrete or masonry which supports a building, including 
footings, stem walls, retaining walls, and grade beams. 

FOUNDATION EXTENDING IN THE DOWNHILL DIRECTION is a foundation 
running downhill and approximately perpendicular to the uphill foundation. 

HILLSIDE BUILDING is any building or portion thereof constructed on or into a 
slope steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3%). If only a 
portion of the building is supported on or into the slope, these regulations apply 
to the entire building. 

PRIMARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and providing a 
direct connection as described in Sections 1613.8.5 and 1613.8.7.3 between the 
diaphragm and the uphill foundation. 

SECONDARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and providing a 
redundant diaphragm to foundation connection, as described in Sections 
1613.8.6 and 1613.8.7.4. 

UPHILL DIAPHRAGM EDGE is the edge of the diaphragm adjacent and closest 
to the highest ground level at the perimeter of the diaphragm. 

UPHILL FOUNDATION is the foundation parallel and closest to the uphill 
diaphragm edge. 

A10-00281 9 



12

1613.8.4 Analysis and Design. 

1613.8.4.1 General. Every hillside building within the scope of this section shall 
be analyzed, designed, and constructed in accordance with the provisions of this 
division. When the code-prescribed wind design produces greater effects, the wind 
design shall govern, but detailing requirements and limitations prescribed in this and 
referenced sections shall be followed. 

1613.8.4.2 Base Level Diaphragm-Downhill Direction. The following provisions 
shall apply to the seismic analysis and design of the connections for the base level 
diaphragm in the downhill direction. 

1613.8.4.2.1 Base for Lateral Force Design Defined. For seismic forces acting in 
the downhill direction, the base of the building shall be the floor at or closest to the top 
of the highest level of the foundation. 

1613.8.4.2.2 Base Shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design, the 
response modification coefficient (R) shall not exceed 4.5 for bearing wall and building 
frame systems. The total base shear shall include the forces tributary to the base level 
diaphragm including forces from the base level diaphragm. 

1613.8.5 Base Shear Resistance-Primary Anchors. 

1613.8.5.1 General. The base shear in the downhill direction shall be resisted 
through primary anchors from diaphragm struts provided in the base level diaphragm to 
the foundation. 

1613.8.5.2 Location of Primary Anchors. A primary anchor and diaphragm strut 
shall be provided in line with each foundation extending in the downhill direction. 
Primary anchors and diaphragm struts shall also be provided where interior vertical 
lateral-force-resisting elements occur above and in contact with the base level 
diaphragm. The spacing of primary anchors and diaphragm struts or collectors shall in 
no case exceed 30 feet (9,144 mm). 

1613.8.5.3 Design of Primary Anchors and Diaphragm Struts. Primary anchors 
and diaphragm struts shall be designed in accordance with the requirements of Section 
1613.8.8. 

1613.8.5.4 Limitations. The following lateral-force-resisting elements shall not be 
designed to resist seismic forces below the base level diaphragm in the downhill 
direction: 

1. Wood structural panel wall sheathing, 

2. Cement plaster and lath, 

A10-00281 10 



13

3. Gypsum wallboard, and 

4. Tension only braced frames. 

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Section 
2205.2.2 may be used to transfer forces from the primary anchors and 
diaphragm struts to the foundation provided lateral forces do not induce 
flexural stresses in any member of the frame or in the diaphragm struts. 
Deflections of frames shall account for the variation in slope of diagonal 
members when the frame is not rectangular. 

1613.8.6. Base Shear Resistance-Secondary Anchors. 

1613.8.6.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required by Section 
1613.8.5, the base shear in the downhill direction shall be resisted through secondary 
anchors in the uphill foundation connected to diaphragm struts in the base level 
diaphragm. 

EXCEPTION: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations extending 
in the downhill direction spaced at not more than 30 feet (9,144 mm) on center 
extend up to and are directly connected to the base level diaphragm for at least 
70% of the diaphragm depth. 

1613.8.6.2 Secondary Anchor Capacity and SpaCing. Secondary anchors at the 
base level diaphragm shall be designed for a minimum force equal to the base shear, 
including forces tributary to the base level diaphragm, but not less than 600 pounds per 
lineal foot (8.76 kN/m). The secondary anchors shall be uniformly distributed along the 
uphill diaphragm edge and shall be spaced a maximum of four feet (1,219 mm) on 
center. 

1613.8.6.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed 
in accordance with Section 1613.8.8. 

1613.8.7 Diaphragms Below the Base Level-Downhill Direction. The following 
provisions shall apply to the lateral analysis and design of the connections for all 
diaphragms below the base level diaphragm in the downhill direction. 

1613.8.7.1 Diaphragm Defined. Every floor level below the base level diaphragm 
shall be designed as a diaphragm. 

1613.8.7.2 Design Force. Each diaphragm below the base level diaphragm shall 
be designed for all tributary loads at that level using a minimum seismic force factor not 
less than the base shear coefficient. 

A10·00281 11 



14

1613.8.7.3 Design Force Resistance-Primary Anchors. The design force 
described in Section 1613.8.7.2 shall be resisted through primary anchors from 
diaphragm struts provided in each diaphragm to the foundation. Primary anchors shall 
be provided and designed in accordance with the requirements and limitations of 
Section 1613.8.5. 

1613.8.7.4 Design Force Resistance-Secondary Anchors. 

1613.8.7.4.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required in Section 
1613.8.7.3, the design force in the downhill direction shall be resisted through 
secondary anchors in the uphill foundation connected to diaphragm struts in each 
diaphragm below the base level. 

EXCEPTION: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations extending 
in the downhill direction, spaced at not more than 30 feet (9,144 mm) on penter, 
extend up to and are directly connected to each diaphragm below the base level 
for at least 700/0 of the diaphragm depth. 

1613.8.7.4.2 Secondary Anchor Capacity. Secondary anchors at each diaphragm 
below the base level diaphragm shall be designed for a minimum force equal to the 
design force but not less than 300 pounds per lineal foot (4.38 kN/m). The secondary 
anchors shall be uniformly distributed along the uphill diaphragm edge and shall be 
spaced a maximum of four feet (1,219 mm) on center. 

1613.8.7.4.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed 
in accordance with Section 1613.8.8. 

1613.8.8 Primary and Secondary Anchorage and Diaphragm Strut Design. 
Primary and secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in accordance 
with the following provisions: 

1. Fasteners. All bolted fasteners used to develop connections to wood 
members shall be provided with square plate washers at all bolt heads and 
nuts. Washers shall be minimum 3/16 inch (4.8 mm) thick and two inch (51 
mm) square for 1/2-inch (12.7 mm) diameter bolts, and 1/4-inch (6.4 mm) 
thick and 2-1/2-inch (64 mm) square for 5/8-inch (15.9 mm) diameter or larger 
bolts. Nuts shall be wrench tightened prior to covering. 

2. Fastening. The diaphragm to foundation anchorage shall not be 
accomplished by the use of toenailing, nails subject to withdrawal, or wood in 
cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension. 

3. Size of Wood Members. Wood diaphragm struts collectors, and other wood 
members connected to primary anchors shall not be less than three-inch (76 
mm) nominal width. The effects of eccentricity on wood members shall be 
evaluated as required per Item 9. 

A10·00281 12 



15

4. Design. Primary and secondary anchorage, including diaphragm struts, 
splices, and collectors shall b� designed for 125% of the tributary force. 

5. Allowable Stress Increase. The one-third allowable stress increase permitted 
under Section 1605.3.2 shall not be taken when the working (allowable) 
stress design method is used. 

6. Seismic Load Factor. The seismic load factor shall be 1.7 for steel and 
concrete anchorage when the strength design method is used. 

7. Primary Anchors. The load path for primary anchors and diaphragm struts 
shall be fully developed into the diaphragm and into the foundation. The 
foundation must be shown to be adequate to resist the concentrated loads 
from the primary anchors. 

8. Secondary Anchors. The load path for secondary anchors and diaphragm 
struts shall be fully developed in the diaphragm but need not be developed 
beyond the connection to the foundation. 

9. Symmetry. All lateral force foundation anchorage and diaphragm strut 
connections shall be symmetrical. Eccentric connections may be permitted 
when demonstrated by calculation or tests that all components of force have 
been provided for in the structural analysis or tests. 

10. Wood Ledgers. Wood ledgers shall not be used to resist cross-grain bending 
or cross-grain tension. 

1613.8.9 Lateral-Foree-Resisting Elements Normal to the Downhill Direction. 

1613.8.9.1 General. In the direction normal to the downhill direction, lateral-force­
resisting elements shall be designed in accordance with the requirements of this 
section. 

1613.8.9.2 Base Shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design, the 
response modification coefficient (R) shall not exceed 4.5 for bearing wall and building 
frame systems. 

1613.8.9.3 Vertical Distribution of Seismic Forces. For seismic forces acting 
normal to the downhill direction the distribution of seismic forces over the height of the 
building using Section 12.8.3 of ASCE 7 shall be determined using the height measured 
from the top of the lowest level of the building foundation. 

1613.8.9.4 Drift Limitations. The story drift below the base level diaphragm shall 
not exceed 0.005 times the story height. The total drift from the base level diaphragm to 
the top of the foundation shall not exceed 3/4 inch (19 mm). Where the story height or 

A10-00281 13 



16

the height from the base level diaphragm to the top of the foundation varies because of 
a stepped footing or story offset, the height shall be measured from the averag e  height 
of the top of the foundation. The story drift shall not be reduced by the effect of 
horizontal diaphragm stiffness. 

Where code-prescribed wind forces govern the design of the lateral force 
resisting system normal to the downhill direction, the drift limitation shall be 0.0025 for 
the story drift and the total drift from the base level diaphragm to the top of the 
foundation may exceed 3/4 inch (19 mm) when approved by the Department. In no 
case, however, shall the drift limitations for seismic forces be exceeded. 

1613.8.9.5 Distribution of Lateral Forces. 

1613.8.9.5.1 General. The design lateral force shall be distributed to lateral­
force-resisting elements of varying heights in accordance with the stiffness of each 
individual element. 

1613.8.9.5.2 Wood Structural Panel Sheathed Walls. The stiffness of a stepped 
wood structural panel shear wall may be determined by dividing the wall into adjacent 
rectangular elements, subject to the same top of wall deflection. Deflections of shear 
walls may be estimated by Section 2305.3.2. Sheathing and fastening requirements for 
the stiffest section shall be used for the entire wall. Each section of wall shall be 
anchored for shear and uplift at each step. The minimum horizontal length of a step 
shall be eight feet (2,438 mm) and the maximum vertical height of a step shall be two 
feet, eight inches (813 mm). 

1613.8.9.5.3 Reinforced Concrete or Masonry Shear Walls. Reinforced concrete 
or masonry shear walls shall have forces distributed in proportion to the rigidity of each 
section of the wall. 

1613.8.9.6 Limitations. The following lateral force-resisting-elements shall not be 
designed to resist lateral forces below the base level diaphragm in the direction normal 
to the downhill direction: 

1. Cement plaster and lath, 

2. Gypsum wallboard, and 

3. Tension-only braced frames. 

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Chapter 22 of 
this Code may be designed as lateral-force-resisting elements in the direction normal to 
the downhill direction, provided lateral forces do not induce flexural stresses in any 
member of the frame. Deflections of frames shall account for the variation in slope of 
diagonal members when the frame is not rectangular. 

A10-00281 14 



17

1613.8.10 Specific Design Provisions. 

1613.8.10.1 Footings and Grade Beams. All footings and grade beams shall 
comply with the following: 

1. Grade beams shall extend at least 12 inches (305 mm) below the lowest 
adjacent grade and provide a minimum 24-inch (610 mm) distance 
horizontally from the bottom outside face of the grade beam to the face of the 
descending slope. 

2. Continuous footings shall be reinforced with at least two No. 4 reinforcing 
bars at the top and two No. 4 reinforcing bars at the bottom. 

3. All main footing and grade beam reinforcement steel shall be bent into the 
intersecting footing and fully developed around each corner and intersection. 

4. All concrete stem walls shall extend from the foundation and reinforced as 
required for concrete or masonry walls. 

1613.8.10.2 Protection Against Decay and Termites. All wood to earth separation 
shall comply with the following: 

1, Where a footing or grade beam extends across a descending slope, the stem 
wall, grade beam, or footing shall extend up to a minimum 18 inches (457 
mm) above the highest adjacent grade. 

EXCEPTION: At paved garage and doorway entrances to the building, the stem 
wall need only extend to the finished concrete slab, provided the wood framing is 
protected with a moisture proof barrier. 

2. Wood ledgers supporting a vertical load of more than 100 pounds per lineal 
foot (1.46 kN/m) and located within 48 inches (1,219 mm) of adjacent grade 
are prohibited. Galvanized steel ledgers and anchor bolts, with or without 
wood nailers, or treated or decay resistant sill plates supported on a concrete 
or masonry seat, may be used. 

1613.8.10.3 Sill Plates. All sill plates and anchorage shall comply with the 
following: 

1. All wood framed walls, including nonbearing walls, when resting on a footing, 
foundation, or grade beam stem wall, shall be supported on wood sill plates 
bearing on a level surface. 

2. Power-driven fasteners shall not be used to anchor sill plates except at 
interior non bearing walls not designed as shear walls. 

A10-00281 15 



18

1613.8.10.4 Column Base Plate Anchorage. The base of isolated wood posts 
(not framed into a stud wall) supporting a vertical load of 4,000 pounds (17.8 kN) 
or more and the base plate for a steel column shall comply with the following: 

1. When the post or column is supported on a pedestal extending above the 
top of a footing or grade beam, the pedestal shall be designed and 
reinforced as required for concrete or masonry columns. The pedestal 
shall be reinforced with a minimum of four No. 4 bars extending to the 
bottom of the footing or grade beam. The top of exterior pedestals shall be 
sloped for positive drainage. 

2. The base plate anchor bolts or the embedded portion of the post base, 
and the vertical reinforcing bars for the pedestal, shall be confined with 
two NO. 4 or three NO. 3 ties within the top five inches (127 mm) of the 
concrete or masonry pedestal. The base plate anchor bolts shall be 
embedded a minimum of 20 bolt diameters into the concrete or masonry 
pedestal. The base plate anchor bolts and post bases shall be galvanized 
and each anchor bolt shall have at least two galvanized nuts above the 
base plate. 

1613.8.10.5 Steel Beam to Column Supports. All steel beam to column supports 
shall be positively braced in each direction. Steel beams shall have stiffener 
plates installed on each side of the beam web at the column. The stiffener plates 
shall be welded to each beam flange and the beam web. Each brace connection 
or structural member shall consist of at least two 5/8 inch (15.9 mm) diameter 
machine bolts. 

26. Section 1613.9 is added to read as follows: 

1613.9 Post Installed Anchors. Post installed anchors may be used when approved by 
the Building Official. When used, these anchors shall be sized and installed in 
accordance with an approval from a recognized approval agency or the manufacturer's 
design criteria and installation specifications. When required by the Building Official, 
post installed anchors shall be tested by an independent testing laboratory to a 
minimum of 1,000 pounds or to twice the allowable design value for the same size bolt, 
whichever is greater. 

Frequency of testing shall be: 
1. One to five bolts per site - two bolts, selected at random shall be tested and 

certified. 
2. More than five bolts - 25 percent of such bolts with a minimum of two shall be 

selected at random to be tested and certified. 

Failing bolts shall be reinstalled and retested to the same criteria. The Building 
Official may require additional bolts to be tested. 

A10-00281 16 



19

27. Section 1704.9 is amended to read as follows: 

1704.9 Cast-In-Place Deep Foundations And Connecting Grade Beams. Special 
inspections shall be pertormed during installation and testing of cast-in-place deep 
foundation elements as required by Table 1704.9. Special inspections shall be 
pertormed for connections to grade beams in accordance with Section 1704.4 for 
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category 0, E, or F. The approved geotechnical 
report, and the construction documents prepared by the registered design 
professionals, shall be used to determine compliance. 

28. Section 1803.1 is amended to read as follows: 

1803.1. General. The classification of the soil at each building site shall be determined 
when required by the building official. An investigation, or investigations, shall be 
conducted for each site by an engineer appropriately licensed in California and reports 
shall be submitted in accordance with CSC Section 1803.6. 

Exceptions: The following may be exempt from this requirement: 

1. Sites having natural formations known by the building official to be 
free of adverse characteristics. 

2. Sites for minor buildings and additions less than one thousand 
(1,000) square feet in area when the building official determines 
that no special site conditions exist 

29. Section 1803.6 is replaced with the following: 

1803.6. REPORTS. When the building official requires that a written report of the soils 
investigation be submitted, that written report of the soils investigation shall include, 
without limitation, the following information: 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

A10-00281 

A plot plan showing the location of all test borings and/or 
excavations and location of cut to-fill "daylight line. II 

Descriptions and classifications of materials encountered. 

Elevation of the water table if encountered. 

Expected total and differential settlement. 

Location of property or site, including address or lot number and 
tract. 

17 



20

6. Description.of site, including existing use of ground, topographical 
irregularities, such as barrancas, existing structures, and elevations 
or ground slopes. 

7. Description of proposed structure. 

8. Boring logs showing subsurface material to a depth of at least ten 
(10) feet. 

9. Expansive indexes, including location and depth of samples. 

10. Any information that may indicate geological or earthquake 
problems, or the potential for hydro consolidation. 

11. Recommendations for foundation type and design criteria, including 
bearing capacity, provisions to minimize the effects of expansive 
soils and hydro consolidation, and the effects of adjacent loads. 

12. Retaining wall design studies and recommendations (if applicable). 

13. Special studies and recommendations concerning the expansion 
potential, erosion potential, erosion control, and irrigation 
requirements, and maintenance requirements on slopes steeper 
than two horizontal to one vertical whenever requested by the 
building official. 

14. Pile and stilt design studies and recommendations (if applicable). 

15. Swimming pool design studies and recommendations (if 
applicable). 

16. Special site investigations (if applicable). 

30. Section 1803.3.2 is added to read as follows: 

1803.3.2. SPECIAL SITE INVESTIGATION. Whenever, in the Building Official's opinion, 
test borings or excavations required by the provisions of CBC Section 1803.3 cannot 
determine the adequacy of a building's overall stability, the Building Official may require 
a special geologic, hydrologic, seismic, liquefaction, or other investigation. Geologic 
investigations, such as hillside stability and potential fault activity, shall be conducted by 
a California Certified Engineering Geologist. 

The engineering geologist's work must be based upon a detailed, accurate topographic 
base map. The map shall be of suitable scale and shall cover the project area as well 
as any adjacent area which may be affected. The map shall include the existing and 

A10-00281 18 



21

proposed contours, location of streets, pads, slopes, structures, and pertinent 
elevations. 

1803.3.2.1. HILLSIDE STABILITY. 

A. Any report required by the Building Official to determine a building's 
stability, will be based upon an investigation conducted to reveal 
any subsurface conditions that may lead to landslides, slump, or 
settlement. It shall include descriptions of topography relief, 
drainage, earth materials and structure, a detailed geological map, 
geologic cross sections and recommendations for site 
development, including consideration for site drainage. 

B. Any such report will also describe the effects of the development on 
the site and adjacent properties and specific conclusions 
concerning the feasibility and anticipated future stability of the 
overall development. Specific recommendations for the correction 
of all known and/or anticipated geologic hazards on the site must 
be included. 

1803.3.2.2. FAUL T ACTIVITY. A report required by the Building Official will include 
information and recommendations concerning: 

A. Surface rupture along faults, including age, type of surface 
displacement and amount of reasonable anticipated future 
displacements of any faults within, or immediately adjacent to, the 
site; definition of any areas of high risk; and recommended building 
restrictions or use limitations within any designated high risk area. 

B. Secondary ground effects, including estimated magnitude and 
distance of all relevant earthquakes, lurching and shallow ground 
rupture, liquefaction of sediments and soils, settlement of soils, and 
potential for earthquake induced landslides. 

31 . Section 1804.7 is added to read as follows: 

1804.7. Site Drainage. 

1804.7.1. Drainage Precautions In Hillside Areas. Where buildings are constructed in 
hillside areas as defined in the San Buenaventura Municipal Code, they shall be 
provided with gutters and site drainage as follows: 

Eave or ground gutters shall be provided to receive all roof water and deliver it through 
a non-erosive device to a street or watercourse. 

A10-00281 19 



22

Building pads shall slope to an approved drainage device or to a public street. Where 
used, the drainage device shall be an adequately designed system of catch basins and 
drain lines which conducts the water to a street, storm drain or natural watercourse 
approved by the building official. 

On site storm water management systems, that do not discharge storm water directly to 
an approved community storm water collection and management system, are permitted 
in hillside areas provided the following documentation is provided to, and approved by, 
the Building Official prior to system construction and/or use: 

1. Storm water management calculations prepared by the State licensed 
Civil Engineer, and 

2. On site storm water system plans and drawings sealed by a State licensed 
Civil Engineer, and 

3. A soils report and proposed storm water system analysis prepared by a 
State licensed and insured Civil Engineer other than the system design 
Engineer. 

1804.7.2. Drainage Precautions In Expansive Soil. Where buildings are constructed on 
soils having an expansive index reading exceeding 90, gutters shall be provided to 
receive all roof water and deliver it through an approved non-erosive device to a street 
or approved water course, unless alternate means of foundation protection 
recommended by the geotechnical engineer and approved by the building official is 
provided. 

32. Section 1809.3 is amended to read as follows: 

1809.3 Stepped Footings. The top surtace of footings shall be level. The bottom surtace 
of footings shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 1 a units 
horizontal (1 O-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change 
the elevation of the top surtace of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes 
more than one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (1 a-percent slope). 

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories D and E, stepped footings shall be 
reinforced with four Y2-inch diameter (12.7 mm) deformed reinforcing bars. Two bars 
shall be placed at the top of the footing and two bars shall be placed at the bottom of 
the footing. 

A10-00281 20 



23

33. Section 1809.4 is amended to read as follows: 

1809.4 Depth Of Footings. The minimum depth of footings below the undisturbed 
ground surface shall be 12 inches (305 mm), but not less than the depth as prescribed 
by Table 1809.7. Where applicable, the requirements of Section 1809.5 shall also be 
satisfied. The minimum width of footings shall be 12 inches (305 mm). 

34. Section 1809.7 is amended to read as follows: 

1809.7. Slab Floor Construction At Or Below Grade. Slab floors on grade for all 
structures, including carports, shall be of Portland cement concrete and comply with the 
minimum requirements of CBC Table No. 1809.7. The following requirements for slab 
floor construction shall be adhered to, except where engineered modifications are 
approved by the building official and continuous inspection during construction is 
provided. 

1. 

2. 

A10-00281 

Loose fill shall be pasted and compacted according to the Building 
Official1s instructions. 

Except for buildings, or portions thereof, used only for agricultural, 
storage, industrial, or similar uses, an approved vapor barrier of not 
less than six (6) mil thickness shall be installed under all slabs. 
Such vapor barrier shall cover all earth or fill material within the 
exterior boundaries of the building. At all footings or barriers, such 
vapor barrier shall be turned up or down at least three (3) inches. In 
no case shall the vapor barrier penetrate within three (3) inches 
horizontally of any fastener used to transfer shear or uplift, such as 
anchor bolts, tiedown bolts and shot pins. Joints shall be lapped a 
minimum of twelve (12) inches or be fastened together with a 
suitable compound with three (3) inches of minimum lap. 

21 



24

35. CBC Table 1809.7 is amended to read as follows: 

Weighted 

expansion No. of Stem 

index stories thickness8 

0-20 1 6 

Very low 2 6 

non expansive 3 10 

21·50 1 6 

Low 2 8 

3 10 

51-90 1 6 

Medium 2 8 

3 10 

91-130 1 6 

High 2 8 

3 10 

Above 130 

very high 

A10-00281 

Table 1809.7-Foundations for stud bearing walls-minimum requirements
1
, 

10,11,12 

Foundation for slab and raised floor systems2,5,7 

Footing Footing All perimeter Interior footings 

width9 thickness footings6 for slab and 

raised Iloors6 

Depth below natural surface 

of ground and finish grade 

Inches 

12 6 12 12 

15 7 18 18 

18 8 24 24 

12 6 15 12 

15 7 18 18 

18 8 24 24 

12 8 21 12 

15 8 21 18 

18 8 24 24 

12 8 27 12 

15 8 27 18 

18 8 27 24 

Concrete slabs 

Reinforcement 3-1/2" minimum thickness 

for·continuous 4" with EL over 51 

foundations 3,8 Reinforcement 4 

1-#4 #4 @ 48" ole.. 

Top and each way 

bottom or 

1-#4 #3 @ 36" o/c .. 

Top and each way 

bottom 

1-#4 top #3 @ 24" o.C. 

and bottom each way 

#3 bars @ 24" o.c. each way 

12" into footing, 36" into slab 10 

2- #4 #3 @ 24" O.c. 

Top & bottom each way 

#3 bars @ 24" o.c. each way 

12" into footing, 36" into slab 10 

Total 

thickness 

of sand 

2" 

4" 

4" 

4" 

Special design by a licensed Architect or Engineer required 

22 

Pre-moisteneing Restrictions on 

of soils under piers under 

footings, piers raised floors 

and slabss,6 

Moistening of ground Piers allowed for 

prior to placing concrete Single floor 

is recommended loads only 

3% over optimum moisture required Piers allowed for 

to a depth of 18" below lowest adjacent single floor 

grade. Testing required, loads only 

3% over optimum moisture required 

to a depth of 18" below lowest adjacent Piers not 

grade. Testing required. allowed 

3% over optimum moisture required 

I to a depth of 18" below lowest adjacent Piers not 

grade. Testing required. allowed 

�----,,--.��-�.--



25
A10-00281 

CBC TABLE 1809.7 FOOTNOTES 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 

7. 

8. 

9. 

Premoistening is required where specified in Table 1805.4.2 in 
order to achieve maximum and uniform expansion of the soil before 
construction and thus limit structural distress caused by uneven 
expansions and shrinkage. Other systems which do not include 
pre-moistening may be approved by the Building Official when such 
alternatives are shown to provide equivalent safeguards against the 
adverse effects of expansive soil. 

Undertloor access crawl holes must be provided with curbs 
extending not less than six (6) inches above adjacent g rade to 
prevent surtace water from entering the foundation area. 

Reinforcement for continuous foundations shall be placed not less 
than 311 above the bottom of the footing and not less than 3" below 
the top of the stem. 

Slab reinforcement shall be placed at slab mid-depth and continue 
to within two inches of the exterior face of the exterior footing walls. 

Moisture content shall be maintained until foundations and piers are 
poured and a vapor barrier is installed. Tests shall be taken within 
24 hours of each slab pour. 

Crawl spaces under raised floors need not be pre-moistened 
except under interior footings. Interior footings which are not 
enclosed by a continuous perimeter foundation system or 
equivalent concrete or masonry moisture barrier shall be 
designated and constructed as specified for perimeter footings in 
Table 1809.7. 

A grade beam not less than 12" x 12" in cross-sectional area, 
reinforced as specified for continuous foundations in Table 
1805.4.2. shall be provided at garage door openings. 

Foundation stem walls which exceed a height of 3 times the stem 
thickness above the lowest adjacent .grade shall be reinforced in 
accordance with CBC Chapters 18 & 19 or as required by 
engineering design, whichever is more restrictive. 

Footing widths may be reduced upon submittal of calculations by a 
registered civil or structural engineer or licensed. architect, but shall 
be a minimum of 12 inches for one and two-story structures and 15 
inches for three-story structures. 

23 



26

10. Bent reinforcing bars between exterior footing and slab shall be 
omitted when the floor is designed as an independent, II floatingll 
slab. 

11 . Fireplace footings shall be reinforced with a horizontal grid located 
3" above the bottom of the footing and consisting of not less than 
NO. 4 bars at 1211 on center each way. Vertical chimney reinforcing 
bars shall be hooked under the grid. 

A 10-00281 24 



27

36. Table 2306.3 is amended to read as fol lows: 

PANEL GRADE 

Structural I 
Sheathing 

Sheathing 
plywood siding9 
except Group 5 

Species 

A1 0-00281 

TABLE 2306.3(1 )  
ALLOWABLE SHEAR (POUNDS PER FOOT) FOR WOOD STRUCTURAL PANEL SHEAR WALLS WITH 

FRAMING OF DOUGLAS FIR-LARCH OR SOUTHERN PINEa FOR WIND OR SEISMIC LOADING b, h, i, j, I, m, [1 

MINIMUM MINIMUM ALLOWABLE SHEAR VALUE FOR SEISMIC FORCES 
NOMINAL FASTENER PANELS APPLIED DIRECTLY TO FRAMING 

PANEL PENETRATION NAIL (common or galvanized Fastener spacing at panel 
THICKNESS IN FRAMING box) or staple sizek Edges inches) 

(inches) (inches) 6 I 4 3 28 

1 -3/8 8d (2W'xO. 1 3 1 "  common, 200 200 200 200 
3/8 2W'xO. 1 1 3" galvanized box) 

1 1 -1 /2 16 Gage 1 55 200 200 200 
1 -3/8 8d (2W'xO. 1 31 "  common, 2550 3950 505a 6700 

7/1 6  2W'xO.1 1 3" galvanized box) 
1 1 -1 /2 1 6  Gage 1 70 260 345 440 

1 -3/8 8d (2W'xO. 1 31 "  common, 280 430 550 730 
1 5/32 2W'xO. 1 1 3" galvanized box) 

1 1 - 1 /2 1 6  Gage 1 85 280 375 475 
1 -1 /2 1 0d (3xO. 1 48" common, 340 510 665' 870 

3"xO.1 28" galvanized box) 
3/8 1 -1 /4 6d (2"xO. 1 1 3" common, 200 200 200 200 

2"xO.099" galvanized box) 
1 -3/8 8d (2W'xO. 1 3 1 "  common, 200a 200a 2000 200u 

2W'xO. 1 1 3" galvanized box) 
1 1 -1 /2 1 6  Gage 1 05 1 58 200 200 

7/1 6  1 -3/8 8d (2W'xO. 1 31 "  common, 2400 3500 450u 5850 

2W'xO. 1 1 3" galvanized box) 
1 1 -1 /2 1 6  Gage 1 55 230 31 0 395 

1 -3/8 8d (2W'xO. 1 31 "  common 260 380 490 640 
1 5/32 2W'xO.1 1 3" galvanized box) 

1 -1 /2 1 Od (3"xO. 1 48" common, 31 0 460 600' 770 
3"xO.1 28" galvanized box) 

1 1 -1 /2 1 6  Gage 1 70 255 335 430 
1 -1 /2 1 0d (3"xO . 1 48" common, 340 510 665' 870 

1 9/32 3"xO.1 28" galvanized box) 
1 1 -3/4 1 6  Gage 1 85 280 375 475 

Nail Size (galvanized casing) 

3/8 1 -3/8 8d (2W'xO. 1 1 3") 1 60 200 200 200 

25 



28

Footnotes to Table 2306.3 
For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 pound per foot = 1 4.5939 N/m. 

a. For framing of other species: ( 1 ) Find specific gravity for species of lumber in AF&PA NOS. (2) For staples find shear value from table 
above for Structural I panels (regardless of actual grade) and multiply value by 0.82 for species with specific gravity of 0.42 or greater, or 
0.65 for all other species . (3) For nails find shear value from table above for nail size for actual grade and multiply value by the following 
adjustment factor: Specific Gravity Adjustment Factor = [1 -(O.5-SG)], where SG = Specific Gravity of the framing lumber. This adjustment 
factor shall not be greater than 1 .  

b. Panel edges backed with 2-inch nominal or thicker framing. I nstall panels either horizontally or vertically. Space fasteners maximum 6 
inches on center along intermediate framing members for 3/8-inch and 7116-inch panels instal led on studs spaced 24 inches on center. 
For other conditions and panel thickness, space fasteners maximum 1 2  inches on center on intermediate supports .  

c .  3/8-inch panel thickness or siding with a span rating of 16 inches on center is  the minimum recommended where applied direct to  framing 
as exterior siding. 

d. Except for wood structural panel sheathing used for shear walls that are part of the seismic-farce-resisting system ,  allowable shear values 
are permitted to be increased to values shown for 1 5/32-inch sheathing with same nail ing provided (a) studs are spaced a maximum of 1 6  
inches o n  center, or (b) panels are applied with long dimension across studs. 

e. Framing at adjoining panel edges shall be 3 inches nominal or wider, and nails shall be staggered where nails are spaced 2 inches on 
center. 

f. Framing at adjoining panel edges shall be 3 inches nominal or wider, and nails shall be staggered where both of the following conditions 
are met: ( 1 ) 1 0d (3"xO . 1 48") nails having penetration into framing of more than 1 -1 /2 inches and (2) nails are spaced 3 inches on center. 

g. Values apply to all-veneer plywood. Thickness at point of fastening on panel edges governs shear values. 
h. Where panels applied on both faces of a wall and nail spacing is less than 6 inches o.c. on either side, panel joints shall be offset to fall on 

different framing members, or framing shall be 3-inch nominal or thicker at adjoining panel edges and nails on each side shall be 
staggered. 

i .  I n  Seismic Oesign Category 0, E ar F, where shear design values exceed 350 pounds per l inear foot, a l l  framing members receiving edge 
nail ing from abutting panels shall not be less than a single 3-inch nominal member, or two 2-inch nominal members fastened together in 
accordance with Section 2306 . 1  to transfer the design shear value between framing members. Wood structural panel joint and sill plate 
nai l ing shall be staggered in all cases. See Section 2305.3. 1 1  for si l l  plate size and anchorage requirements. 

J .  Galvanized nails shall be  hot dipped or  tumbled. 
k. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/1 6 inch and shall be installed with their crowns parallel to the long dimension of the 

framing members. 
1 .  For shear loads of normal or permanent load duration as defined by the AF&PA NOS, the values in the table above shall be multipl ied by 

0.63 or 0 .56,  respectively. 
m. [OSA-SS & OSHPO 1 , 2 and 4] Refer to Section 2305.2.4.2, which requires any wood structural panel sheathing used for diaphragms and 

shear walls that are part of the seismic-farce-resisting system to be applied directly to framing members. 

A1 0-00281 26 



29

37. Chapter 3 1 A is amended to read as fol lows: 

A31 09 . 1  Location 

1. No swimming pool ,  spa or  hot tub wi l l  be constructed in a requ i red front 
yard as defined by this code un less specific approval is granted th rough a 
variance. 

2.  The distance from the inner su rface of a swimming pool ,  spa o r  hot tub 
wal l to a property l ine wi l l  not be less than three feet . Swimming pool and 
spa walls adjacent to foundations and slopes wi l l  be designed in 
accordance with this code.  

A31 09 .2 Defin it ions. For the purpose of  this section , certain terms are def ined as 
fol lows: 

Pool - Any body of water created by artificial means which is designated or  u sed for 
swimming or immersion purposes and any portion of which is capable of contain ing 
water 1 8  inches deep or deeper also cal led swimming pool . P lumbing fixtures s uch as 
bathtubs are exempt.  

Hillside Areas. Areas where there is a d ifference of four feet in original and/or f inal 
grade of any two sides of the pool . 

Expansive Soils. The expansiveness of soils wi l l  be 'classified by the requ i rements 
of the Cal iforn ia Bu i lding Code as adopted by the C ity Counci l .  

A3 109. 3 Pools in Uncertified Fill Soils. Perm its may be issued for the construction of 
"floating" type pools in f i l l  areas when the fol lowing conditions are met .  

A1 0-00281 

3. A complete soi ls investigation of the fi l l  is made by an engineer qua l ified in 
soi ls design and ,  based on the f indings, the engineer establ ishes the 
design cond itions and extends recommendations that would lead to a 
stable and safe pool . 

4. A structural design is prepared by a Registered C ivi l Engineer which 
incorporates the recommendations of the soils investigation as approved 
by the Bui ld ing Officia l .  

5 .  The pool is designed under the assumption that i t  receives vertical support 
from the soi l  lying under the pool bottom . The l imits of the supporting soi l 
wil l  be below a l ine drawn around the perimeter of the pool and located on 
the bottom where a l ine sloping at 44 degrees with the horizontal is 
tangent to the pool bottom .  

27 



30

6.  Pool wal ls wi l l  be designed assuming no support from the surrounding soil 
and in  accordance with the m inimum requirements as set fort h  in this 
Article .  

7 .  The p it for the pool backwash wi l l  not be located with in the fi l l  material . 

A3 109.4 Surface Water. The pool deck and al l portions of the lot wi l l  drain to the street 
or to an approved drainage course . When a pool deck extends to with in three feet of an 
adjacent property, means wi l l  be provided to conduct sp lash water to a satisfactory point 
of d isposal .  

A31 09 .5 Waste Water. Disposal o f  swimming pool wastewater wi l l  be  in conformance 
with this code. 

A31 09.6 Hydrostatic Upl ift . Any pool to be constructed in an area in which 
residual groundwater creates hydrostatic head against the pool structure wi l l  have a 
suitable underdrain rel ief to which a pump can be properly attaches, sufficient mass 
weight to prevent floatation ,  or hydrostatic rel ief valves. 

A31 09 .7 Diving Boards. No d iving board wi l l  be installed in a pool whose greatest 
depth is less than eight feet . A depth of not less than 8 feet , 6 inches, wi l l  be required 
for a one-meter board .  A depth of not less than 1 0  feet wi l l  be requ ired for a three­
meter board .  

A3 1 09 .8 Materials for Pool Shel l .  Swimming pool shel ls wi l l  be of reinforced concrete, 
or other material equ ivalent in strength and durabi l ity, designed and bu i lt to withstand 
anticipated stresses ,  of watertight construction with smooth and impervious su rfaces . A 
waterproof interior fin ish , which wil l  withstand repeated brushing,  scrubbing and 
c lean ing procedures, wi l l  completely line the pool to the coping or canti levered decking .  

A31 09.9 Construction Changes. A l l  changes wi l l  be approved in writing by the design 
engineer or arch itect before they wi l l  be reviewed by the Bui ld ing Official .  

A31 09 . 1  0 Signature of Design Professional . Structural plans and calcu lations wi l l  be 
signed by a Registered Civi l Engineer or Arch itect l icensed by the State of Cal iforn ia for 
any pool where the maximum depth is more than three feet . 

A31 09 . 1 1 Deck. A concrete deck wi l l  be provided around the pool with a m in imum 
width of 4 feet, measured from the pool water l ine and with a 2% slope away from the 
pool .  Natural soi l  under deck wi l l  slope 2% away from the pool and soi l  around the deck 
wil l  slope at 1 % m in imum to drain away from the edge of the deck. The deck wi l l  have 
a minimum th ickness of 4 inches nominal and wi l l  re reinforced with 3/8-inch 
reinforcement bars at 24 inches on center each way or equ ivalent reinforcing. The 
outer edge of the deck wi l l  have a cutoff wal l  not less than 1 5  inches below grade . A 6-
foot deck may be used in l ieu of a 4-foot deck and cutoff wal l .  Decks of lesser width 
may be uti l ized when the cutoff wal l  depth is increased by a proportionate amount of the 

A1 0-00281 28 



31

reduced deck width . When the soi l  under decks has an expansive index of 9 1  or 
greater, it wil l  be presatu rated with water to a depth of 1 8  inches before the p lacement 
of the concrete deck. Approved joints wi l l  be provided in the deck at corners ,  at 
maximum 1 0-foot intervals, and wherever necessary in order to control cracking,  to 
al low for differential movements, and to min imize damage to the deck from such 
movement should it occur. Joints in decks and coping wil l  be made watertight with an 
approved permanent resi l ient sealant. 

Exception : The deck may be omitted provided that the pool shel l  is des igned to 
resist normal external forces plus 20 p .c .f. equ ivalent f lu id pressure ,  and t he  bond 
beam has a th ickness of not less than 1 2  inches and is reinforced with a min i m um of 
three (3) 1 /2-inch reinforcement bars in  each face with %-inch reinforceme nt t ies at 
48 inches on center. 

A31 09 . 1 2  Enclosures. Residential pool enclosures shall be designed, instal led and 
maintained in accordance with Section 31 09.4 of this code.  

A31 09 . 1 3 . Design .  

A .  Minimum Standards. Every swimming pool design wil l  admit to  rational 
analysis according to accepted engineering principles and al l  criteria h ereafter 
noted are to be considered as min imum standards only. 

B. Expansive Soil Design. Pools constructed below grade wi l l  be designed on 
the assumption that their construction is to be in an area of moderately 
expansive soi l having an expansion index of 5 1 -91  and an equ iva lent f lu id 
pressu re of not less than 45 pounds per cubic foot (45 p .c .f . )  
Exception : Where tests indicate that soi ls at a pool site are non-expansive or 
have low expansion characteristics from the ground surface to the fu l l  depth 
of the pool ,  structu ral design may be based on an equ ivalent f lu id p ressure 
not less than 30 p .c .f. 

In h ighly expansive soils having an expansion index of 9 1 - 1 30, pools  wi l l  be 
designed for not less than 60 p .c .f. equ ivalent flu id pressure .  

In very h ighly expansive soi ls having an expansion index over 1 30, pool 
design wi l l  be subject to special requ i rements based on a site investigation,  
soi l  test ing, and engineering analysis by a registered civi l engi neer to 
determine appropriate design parameters for the site . 

C .  Hydrostatic Pressure. Hydrostatic pressure wi l l  be used in an outward 
direction as a design criteria where concrete is not deposited against natura l  
und isturbed earth or approved compacted fi l l .  

D.  Reinforcing Steel. Minimum reinforcing steel wi l l  be no less than 3/8- inch 
reinforcement bars at 1 2  inches C.C . both ways, with a min imum cover of two 

A1 0-00281 29 



32

inches, except longitudinal stee l  in the bottom transition area from the shal l  to 
deep end wi l l  be 3/8-inch reinforcement bars at six inches O .C .  m in imum,  
extending a m in imum distance of five feet beyond each side of the transition . 

E .  Empty Pool Condition. Pools wi l l  be designed for both empty and fi l led 
conditions. 

F .  Surcharge Loads. When located adjacent to bui ld ing foundations, retain ing 
wal ls and ascending earth slopes, appropriate surcharge loading wi l l  be 
incorporated in the pool design . 

G .  Bond Beams - A top bond beam wil l  be provided with a min imum width and 
depth of 1 2  inches and with a min imum of four  1h-inch reinforcement bars 
(two 1h-inch reinforcement bars near each face) with %-inch reinforcement 
ties at 48 inches on center. Vertical steel wi l l  be bent at least e ight inches 
horizontal ly over top longitudinal steel and wi l l  be carried around the corner 
and lapped to form a rig id construction . Special design and p lan detai ls wi l l  
be required for any n iches or indentation sin the steel or other special detai ls .  

H. Pool Walls. The m inimum th ickness of pool wal ls wi l l  be five inches. 

38 . Section 3405 .6 is added to read as fol lows: 

3405.6 Post-Damage Assessment. 

3405 .6 . 1 Adoption and Intent. This section establ ishes regu lations as amendments to 
the bui ld ing code for the expeditious assessment and marking of damaged structures. 
This section also establ ishes standard placards to be used to indicate the cond it ion of a 
structu re for continued occupancy. The section further authorizes the Bui ld ing Official 
and his or her authorized representatives to post the appropriate p lacard at each entry 
point to a bui lding or structure upon completion of a safety assessment . 

3405.6.2 Defin itions. For the purposes of this section, the fol lowing defin ition appl ies: 

3405.6.3 Safety Assessment. A visual ,  non-destructive examination of a bu i ld ing or 
structu re for the purpose of determ ining the condition for continued occupancy. 

3405 .6 .4 Placards. 

3405.6.4 . 1 Descriptions. The fol lowing are verbal descriptions of the official j u ri sdiction 
placards to be used to designate the condition for continued occupancy of bu i ld ings or 
structures . 
( 1 ) INSPECTED - Lawfu l Occupancy Perm itted is to be posted on any bu i ld ing or 
structure wherein no apparent structural hazard has been found.  Th is p lacard is not 
intended to mean that there is no damage to the bu i lding or structure .  

A1 0-00281 30 



33

(2) RESTRICTED USE is to be posted on each bui ld ing or structu re that has been 
damaged wherein the damage has resulted in  some form of restriction to the continued 
occupancy. The ind ividual who posts this p lacard wi l l  note in general terms the type of 
damage encountered and wi l l  clearly and concisely note the restrictions on continued 
occupancy. 
(3) UNSAFE - Do Not Enter or Occupy is to be posted on each bui ld ing or  structure that 
has been damaged such that continued occupancy poses a threat to l ife safety. 
Bu i ld ings or structures posted with th is p lacard shal l  not be entered under any 
circumstance except as authorized in writ ing by the Bu i ld ing Official , or his or her 
authorized representative. Safety assessment teams shal l be authorized to enter these 
bu i ld ings at any t ime. This placard is not to be used or considered as a demolit ion order. 
The individual who posts th is ' placard wi l l  note in genera l  terms the type of damage 
encountered . 

3405.6 .4 .2 Reference. This ord inance number, the name of the jurisd iction,  its address, 
and phone number shal l be permanently affixed to each placard .  

3405.6 .4 .3 Removal o f  Placards. Once i t  has been attached to a bu i ld ing or structu re ,  a 
placard is not to be removed , altered or covered unti l  done so by an authorized 
representative of the Bu i ld ing Official. It shall be unlawfu l  for any person , f i rm or 
corporation to alter, remove, cover or deface a placard un less authorized pursuant to 
this section . 

3405.6 .5 Repairs .  Repairs of structural elements shal l comply with section 3405 . 

SECTION 3: CAL IFORNIA ENVI RONMENTAL QUALITY ACT EXEMPTION . The c ity 
counci l  determines that th is ordinance is exempt from review under the Cal iforn ia 
Environmental Qual ity Act (Cal iforn ia Publ ic Resources Code §§ 2 1 000, et seq. , 
"CEQA") and the regulations promu lgated thereunder ( 1 4 Cal iforn ia Code of 
Regu lations §§ 1 5000, et seq. , the "State CEQA Gu idel ines")  because it consists on ly of 
m inor revisions and clarifications to an exist ing code of construction-re lated regu lations 
and specification of procedures related thereto and wi l l  not have the effect of delet ing or 
substantial ly changing any regu latory standards or find ings required therefor. Th is 
ord inance, therefore,  is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the 
environment and that does not have the potential to cause sign ificant effects on the 
environment . 

SECTION 4: SAVI NGS CLAUSE.  Repeal of  any provision of  the SBMC or any other  c ity 
ordinance herein wi l l  not affect any penalty, forfeitu re,  or l iabi l ity incurred before , or  
preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before, the 
effective date of this Ordinance .  Any such repealed part wi l l  remain i n  fu l l  force and 
effect for sustaining action or prosecuting vio lations occurring before the effective date 
of this Ordinance. 

A1 0-00281 3 1  



34

SECTION 5 :  EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ord inance wi l l  take effect on the 31 st day 
fol lowing its final passage and adoption or January 1 ,  201 1 ,  whichever is later. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _ day of _____ , 20 1 0 . 

ATTEST: 

Mabi Covarrubias Pl isky 
City Clerk 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

BY:_� ____ _ 

Ariel Pierre Calonne 
City Attorney 

A1 0-00281 32 

Bi l l  Fulton ,  Mayor 



35

ORDINANCE NO. 201 0-

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 
201 0 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE 
AND AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIONS THEREOF 
THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL NECESSITY 

The Counci l of the City of San Buenaventura does ordain as fol lows: 

SECTION 1 :  F IND INGS.  The City Counci l  finds and determines that local c l imatic, 
topographic, and geographical conditions exist as fol lows: 

A. Cl imatic and Geological .  The C ity has moist coastal air and some 
corrosive native soi l .  

B .  After due consideration, the City Counci l finds and determines that  these 
local c l imatic and geological cond it ions make modifications and changes to the 
20 1 0  Edition of the Cal iforn ia E lectrical Code reasonably necessary to provide 
sufficient and effective protection of l ife, health and property. 

SECTION 2: AMENDMENTS. Chapter 1 2 . 1 25 of D ivision 1 2  of the San Buenaventura 
Mun icipal Code ("SBMC") is amended in its enti rety to read as fol lows: 

Electrical Standards 

Section 1 2.1 25.01 0. Adoption of the Cal ifornia Electrical Code, 201 0 Edition.  

Pursuant to Government Code sections 50022 . 1  to 50022 .8 ,  inclusive, Part 3 of 
Title 24 of the Cal iforn ia Code of Regulations, known as the Cal iforn ia E lectrica l  Code, 
201 0  Edition ("CEC") , is adopted by reference, subject to the amendments, additions 
and delet ions set forth in th is chapter. One true copy of the CEC, is on fi le and in the 
office of the Bui ld ing Official and the City Clerk and is available for publ ic inspection as 
required by law. 

Section 1 2. 1 25.020. Amendments. 

A. The C ity Counci l finds and determ ines that local cl imatic ,  and 
geographical conditions exist as fol lows: The City has moist coastal air and some 
corrosive native soi l .  

B .  After due consideration , the City Counci l finds and determines that these 
local cl imatic and geological cond itions make modifications and changes to the 
C EC reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of l ife , 
health and property. The CEC is therefore modified, amended, added to, and 
changed as set forth below: 

A1 0-00281 1 



36

1 .  Section 90. 1  (C) is amended to read as fol lows: 

90. 1  (C) I ntention. For the purposes of establish ing fees, adm in istering 
permits and inspections, processing alternate methods of compl iance , hearing 
appeals, and other local adm in istrative reasons, the 20 1 0  California Bu i ld ing 
Code as adopted in SBMC Chapter 1 2 . 1 1 5  wi l l  be used . 

FPN: For administrative purposes, the 201 0  Cal iforn ia Bu i lding Code appl ies to both 
residential and non-residential electrical appl ications. 

2 .  Section 690.4 Item C is appended to read as fol lows: 

(1 ) One and Two Fami ly Residential Bui ld ings. Modules shal l  be 
located in a manner that provides two (2)  three-foot (3') wide access pathways 
from the eave to the ridge on each roof slope where modules are located . 
Modu les shal l  be located no c loser than eighteen ( 1 8") inches to a h ip or  a val ley 
if modu les are to be placed on both sides of a hip or val ley. I f  the modules a re to 
be located on only one side of a h ip or val ley that is of equal length then the 
modules may be placed d irectly adjacent to  the h ip or  val ley. The modu les shal l  
be located no higher than three feet (3') below a ridge . 

(2) Commercial Bui ldings and Residential Housing Comprised of 
Three or More Units. 

There shal l be a min imum six foot (6') wide clear perimeter around the edges of the  
roof. 

EXCEPTION : If either axis of the bu i ld ing is 250 feet or less, there shal l be a 
min imum four feet (4') wide clear perimeter around the edges of the roof. 

Pathways shall be establ ished in the design of the solar instal lation . Pathways 
should meet the fol lowing requirements: 

a .  Shal l be over structural members 
b .  Centerl ine axis pathways shal l be provided in both axis of the roof. Centerl ine 
axis pathways shou ld run on structural members or over the next closest 
structural member nearest to the center l ines of the roof 
c. Shal l  be straight l ine not less than 4 feet (4') clear to skyl ights and/or 
venti lation hatches 
d. Shal l  be straight l ine not less than 4 feet (4') clear to roof standpipes 
e. Shall provide not less than 4 feet (4') clear around roof access hatch with at 
least one not less than 4 feet (4') clear pathway to parapet or roof edge 

. Smoke Venti lation 

a. Arrays shal l  be no greater than 1 50 by 1 50 feet in d istance in either axis 
b. Venti lation options between array sections shal l  be either: 

A1 0-00281 2 



37

A pathway 8 feet (8') or greater in  width 4 feet (4') or greater in  width pathway 
and bordering on existing roof skyl ights or venti lation hatches 
4 feet (4') or greater in width pathway and bordering fou r  feet (4') x 8 feet 8' "vent ing 
cutouts" every 20 feet (20') on alternating s ides of the pathway. 

FPN: This gu idel ine does not apply to non-habitable structu res. Examples of 
non-habitable structures include, but are not l im ited to, parking shade structures , solar 
trel l ises, etc. Exception : If a local f ire department determines that the roof config u ration 
is s imi lar to residential (such as in  the case of townhouses, condomin iums, or s ing le 
family attached bu i ld ings) , the local fire department may make a determination to apply 
the residential access and venti lation requ i rements . 

3 .  Section 690.4 (E) is added to read as fol lows: 

(E) Marking or Labeling Required. Wiring methods and enclosures contai n ing 
PV sou rce conductors must be marked with the word ing "Photovoltaic Power Source" 
by labels or other approved permanent marking means su itable for the environment and 
placed with a maximum of 1 a ft of spacing on raceways. In addition al l  junction boxes 
with DC or AC array output circu its shal l  be marked in the same manner. 

4. Section 690.31  (E) is appended to read as fol lows: 

(1 ) Beneath Roofs. Wiring methods for PV system conductors are not perm itted 
with in 1 0  in. of the roof decking,  sheath ing, or framing members except where located 
d irectly below the roof surface that's covered by PV modules and associated 
equipment. Wiring methods for PV system conductors must be run perpendicu lar  (90°) 
to the roof penetration point. 

FPN: The 1 0  in .  from the roof decking/sheathing/framing members requirement 
is to prevent accidental contact to energized conductors from saws used by firefighters 
for roof venti lation during a structure fire. 

(2) Flexible Wiring Methods. FMC smaller than trade size 3A i nch or Type MC 
cable smaller than 1 inch in diameter instal led across cei l ings or f loor jOists must be 
protected by substantial guard strips that are at least as h igh as the wi ring method . 
Where run exposed , other than within 6 ft of their connection to equipment, wiring 
methods must closely fol low the bu i ld ing su rface or be protected from physical damage 
by an approved means. 

SECTION 3 :  CAL IFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT EXEMPTION . The C ity 
Council determines that this ord inance is exempt from review under the Cal i fo rn ia 
Environmental Qual ity Act (Cal iforn ia Public Resources Code §§ 2 1 000, et seq. , 
"CEQA") and the regu lations promu lgated thereunder ( 1 4 Cal iforn ia Code of 
Regulations §§ 1 5000, et seq. , the "State CEQA Guidel ines") because it consists on ly of 
m inor revisions and clarifications to an exist ing code of construction-related regu lations 
and specification of procedures related thereto and wil l  not have the effect of delet ing  or 

A1 0-00281  3 



38

substantial ly changing any regu latory standards or f indings requ ired therefor. This 
ord inance, therefore, is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the 
environment and that does not have the potential to cause significant effects on the 
environment. 

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE.  Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any other city 
ord inance herein wi l l  not affect any penalty, forfeitu re ,  or  l iabi l ity incurred before , or 
preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before ,  this 
Ordinance's effective date . Any such repealed part wi l l  remain in fu l l  force and effect for 
sustain ing action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date of th is 
Ord inance. 

SECTION 5:  EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance wi l l  take effect on the 3 1  st day 
fol lowing its final passage and adoption or January 1 , 201 1 , wh ichever is later. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _ day of _____ , 201 0. 

ATIEST: 

Mabi Covarrubias P l isky 
City Clerk 

APPR0E"0 FORM:  

By: . 
Ariel P ierre Calonne 
City Attorney 

A1 0-0028 1  

Bi l l  Fulton , Mayor 

4 



39

ORDINANCE NO. 201 0-___ _ 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY 
REFERENCE THE 201 0 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND AMENDING 
CERTAIN PROVISIONS THEREOF THROUGH 
EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL NECESSITY 

The Counci l of the C ity of San Buenaventura does ordain as fol lows: 

SECTION 1 :  F IND INGS.  The C ity Counci l f inds that certain local cl imatic , 
geological , or topographical cond itions exist as fol lows: 

A. Cl imatic .  The City experiences periods of extremely h igh 
temperatu res accompanied by low humidity and h igh winds each year. 
These conditions could create an envi ronment in which the Fire 
Department may be unable to control f i res occurring in vegetation as wel l  
as structures not having bu i lt in f ire protection . 

B .  Geological . The City is located in  a seismically active area .  A 
sign ificant earthquake cou ld render the Fire Department incapab le  of 
providing adequate f ire protection . I n  that instance, bu ilt- in f ire protect ion 
wou ld be rel ied upon for control l ing most structural f ires. 

C .  Topographical . The City has developed areas of steep h i l ls id es.  
These h i l lsides create Fire Department access problems which can 
prevent the t imely extingu ishment of f i res in  structures not having bu i lt-i n  
fire protection . Additionally, many structures in the h i l lside area are 
subject to exposure from f i res occurring in  native vegetation remain ing on 
undeveloped land parcels. 

D .  After due consideration , the C ity Counci l f inds and determ ines that 
these local c l imatic, geologic, and topographic conditions m ake 
modifications and changes to the 20 1 0  Edition of the Cal iforn ia Fire Code 
reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of l ife , 
health and property. 

E. The City Counci l ,  fol lowing d ue consideration , f inds and determ ines 
that, due to these local c l imatic, geological ,  or topographical condit ions ,  
amendments, additions, and deletions to the Cal ifornia Fire Code, 201 0 
Edition , are reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective levels  
of fire safety for the protection of l ife , health and property. Specifical ly, the 
fol lowing amendments are made through San Buenaventura Mun ic ipa l  
Code section 1 4 .01 0 .020 which : 

A1 0·00281 1 



40

1 .  Al lows the Fire Chief to apply f ire appl iance requ i rements to residential 
occupancies in  order to address the periods of low humidity and h igh 
winds, potentia l  seismic activity, or areas of restricted access present in 
the City. 

2 .  Provides a means of ensuring that fi re protection systems are instal led 
and maintained in a manner that will provide adequate protection d u ring 
periods of low humidity and h igh winds, potential seismic activity, or  in 
areas of restricted access present in the City. 

3. Requires the instal lation of f ire sprinklers in most new bui ld ings/structu res, 
those structures/bu i ldings to which specified additions are made , and 
structures/bu i ldings in which occupancy use changes are made that 
increase the fi re and l ife safety hazard of the structures/bu i ld ings in o rder 
to provide adequate f ire protection during periods of low humidity and h igh 
winds, potential seismic activity, or in  areas of restricted access present in 
the City. 

4 .  Controls the storage of hazardous materials, including but not l imited to 
flammable l iquids in order to reduce the danger from f ire during periods of 
low humidity and high winds, potential seismic activity, or in areas of 
restricted access present in the City. 

5. Limits the use of fi reworks and pyrotechn ic devices to state-l icensed 
techn icians to reduce the danger from fire during periods of low humid ity 
and high winds, or in areas of restricted access present in the C ity. 

6 .  Limits the growth of hazardous vegetation and maintains defensible s pace 
around bu i ld ings and structures in order to reduce the danger from fire 
during periods of low humid ity and h igh winds, o r  in  areas of restr icted 
access present in  the C ity. 

SECTION 2: Chapter 1 4.01 0 of D ivision 1 4  of the City of San Buenaventura 

Munic ipal Code ("SBMC") is amended in its enti rety to read as fol lows: 

FIRE REGULATIONS 

Section 1 4.01 0.01 0. Adoption of Cal ifornia Fire Code, 201 0 Edition .  

Pursuant to  Government Code §§ 50022 . 1  to  50022 .8, inclusive, Part 9 of 
Title 24 of the Cal iforn ia Code of Regulations, known as the Cal iforn ia Fire Code, 
20 1 0  Edition ("CFC") , is adopted by reference subject to the amendments, 
addit ions and deletions set forth in Section 1 4 .01 0 .020 of this chapter. Adoption 
of the CFC includes CFC Appendix Chapters B, C, 0, E, F, G, H, and J. The 
CFC wi l l  apply to al l  occupancies within the City's jurisdiction .  One ( 1 ) true copy 

A1 0-00281 2 



41

of the CFC is on f i le in  the office of the fire marshal and is avai lable for publ ic 
inspection as requ i red by law. 

Section 1 4.01 0.020. Amendments . 

A. The City Counci l  finds that certain local c l imatic, geologica l ,  or  
topographical conditions exist as fol lows: 

1 .  Climatic - The C ity experiences periods of extremely h igh 
temperatures accompanied by low hum id ity and high winds each 
year. These conditions could create an environment in which the 
Fi re Department may be unable to control f ires occurring i n  
vegetation as  wel l  as structu res not having bu i lt in  f ire protection .  

2 .  Geological - The City is located in a seismically active area .  A 
sign ificant earthquake cou ld render the Fire Department incapable 
of providing adequate f ire protection . I n  that instance, bui lt-in f i re 
protection would be rel ied upon for control l ing  most structural fi res . 

3 .  Topographical - The City has developed areas of  steep h i l ls ides .  
These h i l lsides create Fire Department access problems which can 
prevent the t imely extingu ishment of f i res in  structures not having  
bu i lt-in f ire protection . Additional ly, many structures in the h i l ls ide 
area are subject to exposure from fi res occurring in n ative 
vegetation remain ing on undeveloped land parcels. 

B .  After due consideration , the City Counci l  f inds and determines that 
these local c l imatic, geological , or topograph ical conditions m ake 
additions, modifications and changes to the CFC reasonably necessary to 
provide sufficient and effective levels of fire safety for the protection of l ife , 
health and property. The CFC is therefore modified, amended , added to,  
and changed as set forth below: 

1 .  CFC § 105. 6. 12. is amended to read as fol lows: 

Section 105. 6. 12. Dry Cleaning P lants . An operational permit is 
required to engage in the business of dry clean ing uti l iz ing flammable or 
combustible l iqu ids as the clean ing solvent or to change to a more 
hazardous clean ing solvent. Such permits wi l l  prescribe the class of 
system to be used. 

2. CFC § 105. 6.20. 1 is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 105.6.20. 1 Sale or del ivery without perm it . No person shal l sel l ,  
del iver o r  cause to  be del ivered any hazardous commodity to  any person 

A1 0-00281 3 



42

not in  possession of a val id permit when such permit is required by the 
provisions of this code. 

3 .  CFC § 1 08. 1 i s  amended to read as fol lows: 

Section 108. 1 Appeals to determine the suitabi l ity of alternate materials 
and types of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations of 
the provisions of this code wi l l  be heard and determined in the fol l owing 
manner: 

1 .  The appeal wi l l  be fi rst di rected in writing to the fire code official .  
The f ire code offic ial wi l l  render an appeal decision and f inding in 
writ ing to the appel lant. 

2. I n  the event an appel lant is not satisfied with an appeal decision 
and f inding rendered by the fire code official , a further appeal may 
be made in writing to the Local Appeals Board (Board) with in th irty 
(30) days of the decision and f inding. This Board ,  establ ished in 
Section 1 1 3 of the Cal iforn ia Bui lding Code as adopted by the City, 
wi l l  also act as the Board of Appeals with respect to the CFC.  

4. CFC § 202 is amended to add the fol lowing def in it ion: 

"Addition to a bui ld ing or structure" is an extension or increase in 
floor area or height of a bu i lding or structu re. 

5 .  CFC § 202 is amended to read as fol lows: 

"Person " is a natural person ,  his or her heirs, executors, 
administrators or assigns, and also includes a f irm , partnersh ip whether 
general or l im ited , corporation , un incorporated association , un ion or 
organization , cooperative and trust, its or  thei r successors or assigns ,  or 
the agent of any of the aforesaid . I t  shal l  include the p lural as wel l  as the 
singular number, the male and female gender, and al l  governm ental 
entities subject in  whole or in part to th is Code and the codes adopted by 
reference herein .  

6 .  CFC § 202 is amended to add the fol lowing defin it ion :  

"Undetermined Use" means a bui lding/structure i f  the specific 
occupancy type is not determined at the time of perm it application for the 
instal lation of a fire protection system. 

7 .  CFC § 304. 1 .2 is amended to read as fol lows: 

A1 0-00281 4 



43

Section 304. 1 .2 Vegetation . Weeds, grass , vines or other growth that is  
capable of being ign ited and endangering property, shal l  be cut down and 
removed by the owner or occupant of the premises. Vegetation c learance 
requirements i n  u rban-wi ld land interiace areas, hazardous watershed f ire 
areas, hazardous f ire areas and parcels declared a publ ic nu isance shal l  
be in accordance with Appendix K.  

8 .  CFC § 305.5 is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 305. 5. Chimneys used with f ireplaces or heating appl iances in 
which sol id or l iqu id fuel  is used wi l l  be maintained with a spark arreste r  as 
approved by the f ire code official . 

9. CFC § 3 1 1 .  1 .  1 is amended to replace the reference to the 
International Property Maintenance Code with a reference to the Ventura 
City Property Maintenance Code. 

1 0 . CFC § 3 1 1 .6  is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 3 1 1 .6  - Properly or Materials Damaged by Fire. 

Section 31 1 .6. 1 . The owner, or other person having under their control  
any property or materials damaged by f ire wi l l  secure the property e ither 
by boarding up  al l  openings, fencing , barricading or other appropriate 
measures as d i rected by the ch ief. 

Section 31 1 .6.2. Al l debris and/or damaged materials will be rem oved 
form the property in the manner and within the t ime frame establ ished by 
the ch ief. 

1 1  . CFC § 3 1 6  is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 316 - Combustible Materials Subject to Spontaneous Ignition 

Section 316. 1 General . Combustible materials subject to spontaneous 
ignition shal l be keptin accordance with Section 31 6 .  

Section 316.2 Prevention of Ignition . Materials shal l  be  stored, handled , 
treated and monitored as necessary and in such a manner as to prevent 
ignition . 

Section 316. 3  Provisions for Extingu ishment. The owner or person 
responsible for materials regulated by Sec 3 1 6 shal l provide the 
necessary means to extinguish a f ire shou ld ignit ion occur. P i les shal l  be 
arranged in a manner to not exceed the capabi l ity of avai lable resou rces 

A1 0-00281 5 



44

to ext inguish a f ire in a single pi le .  Access for f irefight ing apparatus shal l  
be approved by the f ire code official . 

1 2 . CFC § 503. 6 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 503.6 Security gates. The instal lation of secu rity gates across a 
fire apparatus access road shal l  be approved by the f ire chief .  Where 
security gates are instal led , they shal l have an approved means of 
emergency operation . The security gates and the emergency operation 
shal l be maintained operational at al l  t imes. Electric gate operators,  where 
provided , shal l  be l isted in accordance with UL 325. Gates intended for 
automatic operation shall be designed , constructed and instal led to 
comply with the requ irements of ASTM F 2200 and be provided with a f i re 
department approved key switch. 

1 3 . CFC § 505. 1 .  1 is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 505. 1 .  1 Directories. When requ i red by the fire code off ic ia l , 
complexes with mu lt iple bu i ld ings may be requ i red to provide d i rectories, 
premise maps and d irectional signs. The scale, design and location of 
directories shal l be approved by the f ire code official and may be requ i red 
to be i l luminated. 

1 8 . CFC § 903.3.5. 1 . 1 is deleted . 

1 9 . CFC § 903.4.2 is amended to read as fol lows: 

Section 903.4.2 Alarms. One exterior approved audible device sha l l  be 
connected to every automatic sprinkler system in an approved locat ion .  
Such sprinkler water-flow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow 
equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smal lest orifice s ize 
instal led in the system. Where a bu i ld ing fire alarm system is instal led,  
actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the bu i lding f i re 
alarm system . 

Section 903.4.2. 1 Bui ld ings with fire sprinkler monitoring systems shal l  be 
provided with an approved audio/visual notification device in each 
occupancy. 

20. CFC § 907. 7.2. 1 is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 907. 7.2. 1 Secondary power supply capacity. The secondary 
power supply capacity shal l  be of an approved type and shal l  provide a 
minimum of 60 hours of power under non alarm conditions and sha l l  be 
capable of operating al l  alarm notification appl iances for 5 m inutes after 60 
hours. 

' 

A1 0-00281 6 



45

EXCEPTION:  F i re alarm and sprinkler monitoring systems meeting the 
requ i rements of a central station f ire alarm system per N FPA 72. 

21 . CFC § 2206.2.3 is amended to read as fol lows: 

Section 2206.2. 3 Above-ground tanks shal l not be used for automotive 
fuel d ispensing at any retai l  sales occupancy. Aboveground tanks sha l l  not 
be used for the storage of C lass I ,  I I  or I l iA l iquid motor fuels except as 
provided by th is section .  

1 .  Above-ground tanks used for outside, above-grade storage of 
Class I l iqu ids shal l  be l isted and labeled as protected above-ground tanks 
and be in accordance with Chapter 34. Such tanks shall be locate d  in 
accordance with Table 2206.2 .3 .  

2 .  Above-ground tanks used for above-grade storage of Class I I  or 
l i lA l iqu ids are al lowed to be protected above-ground tanks or, when 
approved by the fire code official , other above-ground tanks that comply 
with Chapter 34. Tank locations shal l  be in accordance with Table 
2206.2 .3 .  

3 .  Tanks containing fuels shal l not exceed 1 2 ,000 gallons (45 420 L) 
in ind ividual capacity or 48,000 gal lons ( 1 8 1 ,680 L) in aggregate capacity. 
Instal lations with the maximum al lowable aggregate capacity sha l l  be 
separated from other such instal lations by not less than 1 00 feet (30,480 
mm) .  

4. Tanks located at farms, construction projects , or ru ral areas shal l  
comply with Section 3406.2 .  

22. CFC § 3308. 1 .2 is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 3308. 1 .2 Storage. A perm it is required to store f ireworks i n  any 
quantity and wi l l  only be issued for storage associated with a d isplay or for 
the use of pyrotechn ic special effects material by state-l icensed 
pyrotechn icians as described in section 3308. 1. 1 .  

23. CFC § 3308.2 is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 3308.2 Proh ib it ion . The manufacturing , possession , storage, sale,  
use and handl ing of f i reworks is prohib ited . 

EXCEPTIONS: 

A1 0-00281 7 



46

1 .  Storage of f i reworks in accordance with Section 3308. 1 .2. 

2 .  Use and handl ing of fi reworks for d isplay in accordance with 
Section 3308. 1 .  

24 . CFC § 3308.3 is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 3308.3 Firing.  Al l  f ireworks d isplays shall be e lectrical ly f ired . 

25 . CFC § 3404.2.9.6. 1 is amended to read as fol lows: 

Section 3404.2.9. 6. 1 .  Storage of C lass I and C lass \ I  l iqu ids in above­
ground tanks outside of bu i ld ings is prohibited with in  the City l imits of the 
City of San Buenaventu ra .  

EXCEPTIONS: 

( 1 ) Tanks with a maximum capacity of five hundred (500) 
gal lons temporarily instal led at construction sites may be perm itted 
by the fire code official if installed in accordance with this code and 
related local regu lations. 

(2) Existing faci l ities in compl iance with requ i rements of th is 
code may have their use continued with approval of the fire code 
official . 

(3) Upon approval of the f ire code officia l ,  above ground tanks 
with a maximum capacity of five hundred (500) gal lons may be used 
for the storage of crankcase drainings from internal  combustion 
engines. 

(4) Aboveground storage tanks for motor fuel-dispensing 
stations may be al lowed in accordance with section 3404.2 .9 .6. 

26 . CFC § 3405. 6 is added to read as fol lows: 

Section 3405. 6 Dispensing from Aboveground Tanks. Class I and \ I  
l iqu ids wi l l  not be dispensed into the fuel tank of a motor vehicle from 
above-ground tanks except as provided in section 3404.2 .9 .6 .  

27. APPENDIX K is added to read as fol lows 

APPENDIX K - FI RE HAZARD ABATEMENT 

K1 01 . 1  Scope. Th is append ix provides provisions intended to 
identify hazard areas and m itigate the risk to l ife and structures f rom 

A1 0-00281 8 



47

intrusion of f ire from wi ldland fire exposures and fi re exposures f rom 
adjacent structures and to m itigate f ires from spreading to wi ld land fuels 
that may threaten to destroy l ife, overwhelm fire suppression capabi l it ies, 
or result in large property loss. 

K1  0 1 .2 Purpose. The purposes of th is appendix are to i )  estab l ish 
min imum requ i rements in wi ld land-urban interface areas that wi l l  increase 
the abil ity of bu i ld ings to resist the intrusion of flame or burn ing embers 
being projected by a vegetation f ire including;  and i i )  identify hazardous 
fire areas that requ i re appl icable defensible space provisions included in 
th is code and enforced by the f ire code official and appl icable state and 
local f ire-resistive bu i ld ing standards that are requ i red by the local bu i ld ing 
off ic ial . 

K1 02 Definitions. 

K1 02. 1 Defin itions. For the purpose of th is appendix certain terms 
are defined as fol lows: 

COMBUSTIBLE MATERIAL means seasonal and recurrent weeds, 
stubble, brush , dry leaves, tumbleweeds, rubbish , l itter or flammable 
materials of any kind . 

DEFENSIBLE SPACE means an area either natural or man-made, 
where material capable of a l lowing a f ire to spread unchecked has been 
treated, cleared or mod ified to s low the rate and intensity of an advanc ing 
wi ldfi re and to create an area for fire suppression operations to occur. 

HAZARDOUS F IRE AREA means land which is covered with 
grass , grain ,  brush , or forest ,  whether publ ic ly or privately owned, which is 
so situated or is of such inaccessible location that a f ire orig inating u pon 
such land wou ld present an abnormal ly d ifficult job of suppression or 
would potential ly resu lt in great and unusual damage through f i re or 
resu lting erosion . Such areas are designated by the f ire code official . The 
fire code official is authorized to uti l ize as reference the definit ion of 
Hazardous Watershed Fire Area, Local Agency Fire Hazard Severity Zone 
Maps designated pursuant to Cal iforn ia Government Code, Sect ions 
51 1 75 through 5 1 1 89 and the International Wi ld land-Urban Interface 
Code. 

HAZARDOUS WATERSHED F IRE AREA means a location with in 
500 feet of a forest or brush-, grass-, or grain-covered land , exclusive of 
smal l individual lots or parcels of land located outside of a forest or brush- ,  
grass- , or grain-covered area. 

A1 0-00281 9 



48

PARCEL  means a portion of land of any size , the area of wh ich is  
determ ined by the assessor's maps and records and may be identified by 
an assessor's parcel number whether or not any bu i ld ings are present .  

PUBLIC NU ISANCE means a declaration by the f ire code official 
that the presence of combustible material on a parcel creates a fi re 
hazard . 

W ILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE AREA means that geograph ical 
area where structures and other human development meet or interming le 
with wi ldland or vegetative fuels .  

K 1 03 Un lawfu l D isposal . Every person who places, deposits or 
dumps combustible material on a parcel whether or not he owns s uch 
parcel ,  or whether or not he so places, deposits or dumps on such parcel 
with the consent of the owner thereof, is subject to civil penalt ies as  set 
forth in Chapter 1 .050 of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code and to 
crim inal penalties as set forth in the Cal ifornia Health and Safety Code 
Section 1 3871 . 

K1 04 C learance of Brush , Vegetative Growth and Combustib le 
Materia l  from Parcels. Al l parcels declared a publ ic nu isance sha l l  be 
cleared enti re ly of combustible material . If the f ire code official determines 
th is impractical due to hazards posed by the resu lt ing clearance , the 
provisions of Section 1 1 05 may be used . 

K1 05 C learance of Brush and Vegetative Growth Away from 
Structures . Any person owning , leasing , control l ing , operat ing o r  
maintaining any bui ld ing in ,  upon , o r  adjoining any hazardous f ire area ,  
and any person owning, leasing or control l ing any land adjacent to such 
bui ld ing,  shal l at al l  t imes maintain around and adjacent to such bu i ld ing 
an effective f irebreak made by removing and clearing away, a l l  
combustible material for a d istance of  not less than 1 00 feet from a l l  
portions of  the bui ld ing. 

EXCEPTION : S ingle specimens or stands of protected species of 
trees, ornamental shrubbery or s imi lar plants used as ground covers, 
provided they do not form a means of rapid ly transmitt ing a fire from the 
native growth to any bui ld ing.  

K1 06 Prosecution . The f ire code official shal l serve a written order 
upon the owner or possessor of a parcel ,  when in the opin ion of the f i re 
code official , a publ ic nu isance exists thereon . The order shall d i rect such 
owner or possessor to remove or abate the publ ic n uisance per the 
procedures and timeframes out l ined in Chapter 8.0 1 0 of the San 
Buenaventura Municipal Code. 

A1 0-00281 1 0  



49

28 APPENDIX L is added to read as fol lows 

APPENDIX L - FI RE PROTECTION SYSTEMS 

L 1 01 General .  An automatic f ire extinguish ing system shal l  be 
insta lled in a l l  occupancies and locations as set forth in Appendix L and 
Chapter 9 .  

L 1 02 Defin itions. 

BU ILD ING/STRUCTURE,  EXISTING means bu i ld ings or structu res 
perm itted , constructed and f inal authorization for occupancy received prior 
to November 6, 1 99 1  by the authority having jurisdict ion . 

BU ILD ING/STRUCTURE,  NEW means bu i ld ings or structu res 
perm itted , constructed and final authorization for occupancy received on 
or after November 6, 1 99 1  by the authority having ju risd iction . 

FLOOR AREA has the same defin ition as provided in the Cal iforn ia 
Bui ld ing Code 

MULTIPLE USE OCCUPANCIES means bu i ld ings or structu res 
that contain more than one occupancy group l isted in Section 202 as 
determined by the fire code officia l .  

L 1 03 Where required . Approved automatic sprinkler system s  shal l  
be provided in new and exist ing bui ld ings/structures in the locations  as 
described in th is section . 

L 1 03 . 1  New Bui ld ings/Structures . I n  a l l  new bu i ld ings or structu res, 
to be occupied by Groups A,  B ,  E ,  F ,  H, I ,  L M, R ,  S ,  U ,  or mixed u se 
occupancy classifications when over 500 sq . Ft . in f loor area. For a l l  n ew · 
townhouses and one- and two- family dwel l ings an automatic fire sprinkler 
system shall be instal led per the Cal iforn ia Residentia l  Code . 

EXCEPTIONS: 

A1 0-00281 

( 1 ) Detached U occupancy carports used for motor veh icle 
storage intended for no other use or storage that are open on s ixty 
percent (600/0) of exterior wal ls .  Such carports are l imited to th ree 
thousand (3,000) square feet or less in f loor area and wi l l  be 
constructed entirely of noncombustible materials. Treated l umber 
is not al lowed . 

1 1  



50

(2) Detached residential U occupancy carports or garages 
l im ited to one thousand ( 1 ,000) square feet or less in floor area.  

(3) Non combust ib le detached car wash structures, provided  the 
car wash is separated from other structures with an ass umed 
property l ine. 

(4) Publ ic schools shal l comply with Section 903 .2 .2 of this 
code.  

L 1 03 .2 Exist ing Bui ld ings/Structures. 

L 1 03 .2 . 1  I n  al l  existing residential bu i ld ings or structu res when 
cumulative additions are made which resu lt in a total floor area 1 00% or 
greater than the November 6 ,  1 99 1  area of the bui ld ing or structure . 

L 1 03.2 .2 In  al l  other existing bu i ldings/structures, when cumu lative 
additions are made which resu lts in a total bui ld ing/structure floor area 
equal to or greater than five thousand (5000) square feet and the add it ions 
exceed the greater of : 

a) Ten percent ( 1 0% ) of the original floor area, or 
b) Two thousand five hundred (2500) square feet. 

EXCEPTION:  Occupancy types requ ired to have an automatic fi re 
sprinkler system instal led by the Cal iforn ia Bui ld ing Code when the square 
footage is less than 5,000 square feet wi l l  comply with the requ i rements of 
the Californ ia Bui ld ing Code. 

L 1 03.2 .3 In al l  existing bui ld ings/structures, having a total floor area 
equal to  or greater than five thousand (5,000) square feet when a change 
in occupancy classification or use occurs that resu lts in a more hazardous 
use, based on l ife and f ire risk, than the existing occupancy classificat ion 
or use. 

EXCEPTION : Occupancy types requ ired to have an automatic f ire 
sprinkler system instal led by the Cal iforn ia Bui ld ing Code when the square 
footage is less than 5 ,000 square feet wi l l  comply with the requ i rements of 
the Cal iforn ia Bui lding Code. 

L 1 03 .2.4 In  al l  existing bu i ld ings/structu res where renovat ions 
occur requ iring a bui ld ing permit and the total area of the cei l ing coverin g  
removed o r  exposed exceeds 75% o r  greater of the total floor area of the 
bui ld ing/structure. 

A1 0-00281 1 2  



51

EXCEPTION :  Occupancy types required to have an automatic f ire 
sprinkler system instal led by the Californ ia Bui ld ing Code wi l l  comply with 
the requ i rements of the Californ ia Bui ld ing Code. 

L 1 04 Instal lation Requirements 

L 1 04. 1 Modifications 

L 1 04. 1 For the purposes of th is Appendix, f ire wal ls shal l n ot be 
considered as creating separate bu i ld ings . 

L 1 04. 1 .2 Where al lowed, sprinkler systems instal led in accordance 
with NFPA 1 30 in Group R-3 occupancies shal l provide spri nkler 
protection for attached Group U occupancies. 

L 1 04. 1 .2 When NFPA 1 3R sprinkler systems are provided in G roup  
R occupancies, exceptions to, or reductions i n ,  code requ irements are not 
al lowed based on the instal lation of either a NFPA 1 3R or NFPA 1 3  
sprinkler system .  This shal l a lso include requirements in the Cal i forn ia 
Code of Regu lations, Title 24, Part 2 and Part 9 .  

L 1 04. 1 .3 Bu i ldings/structures contain ing mu lt iple use occupancies 
which include one or more Group R occupancies shal l  be protected 
throughout with fi re sprinklers that meet N FPA 1 3  standards. 

SECTION 3 :  CALIFORN IA ENVI RON MENTAL QUALITY ACT EXEMPTIO N .  
The city counci l determines that this ordinance i s  exempt from review under the 
Cal iforn ia Envi ronmental Qual ity Act (Californ ia Publ ic Resources Code §§ 
2 1 000, et seq . ,  t lCEQAtI ) and the regu lations promu lgated thereunder ( 1 4 
California Code of Regu lations §§ 1 5000, et seq . ,  the tlState CEQA Guidel inestl )  
because i t  consists on ly of  minor revisions and clarificat ions to an exist ing code 
of construction-related regu lations and specification of procedures related thereto 
and wil l  not have the effect of deleting or substantially changing any regu lato ry  
standards o r  find ings required therefore . This ord inance, therefore, i s  an act ion 
being taken for enhanced protection of the environment and that does not h ave 
the potential to cause Sign ificant effects on the environment. 

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any 
other city ordinance herein wi l l  not affect any penalty, forfeiture ,  or l iab i l ity 
incurred before , or preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any 
violation occu rring before, this Ord inance's effective date. Any such repealed part 
wi l l  remain in fu l l  force and eff�ct for sustain ing action or prosecuting violat ions 
occurring before the effective date of th is Ordinance. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY. If any part of th is Ordinance or its appl ication is 
deemed inval id by a court of competent jurisdiction , the City Counci l  intends that 

A1 0-00281 1 3  



52

such inval id ity wi l l  not affect the effectiveness of the remaining provisions or 
appl ications and ,  to this end, the provisions of this Ordinance are severable.  

SECTION 6 :  VAL IDITY OF PREVIOUS CODE SECTIONS.  If th is the entire 
Ordinance or its appl ication is deemed inval id by a court of competent 
jurisdiction , any repeal of the SBMC or other the city ord inance by th is 
Ordinance wil l  be rendered void and cause such SBMC provision or othe r  city 
ord inance to remain in fu l l  force and effect for a l l  purposes. 

SECTION 7:  EFFECTIVE DATE. Th is Ordinance wi l l  take effect on the 31 st day 
fol lowing its f inal passage and adoption or January 1 ,  �01 1 , whichever is later. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this __ day of ____ , 201 0 . 

ATTEST: 

Mabi Covarrub ias Pl isky 
City C lerk 

APPRO� TO FORM: 

Ariel Pierre Calonne 
City Attorney 

A1 0-00281 

Bi l l  Fu lton 
Mayor 

1 4  



53

ORDINANCE NO. 201 0-_ 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 
201 0  EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL 
CODE AND AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIONS 
THEREOF THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL 
N ECESSITY 

The Counci l of the C ity of San Buenaventura does ordain as fol lows: 

SECTION 1 :  Chapter 1 2 . 1 30 of D ivision 1 2  of the San Buenaventura Ord inance Code 
( "SBMC") is amended in its enti rety to read as fol lows: 

Mechanical Standards 

Section 12.1 30.01 0. Adoption of the Cal ifornia Mechanical Code, 201 0 Edition. 

Pursuant to Government Code sections 50022 . 1  to 50022.8, inclusive , Part 4 of 
Title 24 of the Cal iforn ia Code of Regulations ,  known as the Cal iforn ia Mechanical 
Code, 20 1 0  Edition ("CMC") , including Appendices A th rough D thereof, and standards 
contained therein , is adopted by reference ,  subject to changes set forth in  this chapter. 
One true copy of said Code, is on fi le in the office of the City Clerk and Bui ld ing Official 
and is available for publ ic inspection as required by law. 

Section 12. 1 30.020. Amendments. 

After due consideration , the City Counci l  finds and determines that due to the n eed to 
establ ish adm in istrative procedures to enforce the CMC,  that changes to the Cal ifornia 
Mechanical Code, 201 0 Edition , are needed and therefore , the CMC is m od ified , 
amended , added to , and changed as set forth below: 

1 .  Section 1 00 is added to read as fol lows: 

1 00. Administrative Coordination of Codes. For the purposes of establ ishing 
fees, admin istering permits and inspections, processing alternate methods of 
compl iance, hearing appeals,  and other local administrative reasons, i n  p lace of 
Chapter 1 ,  Division I I  of the CMC, the 201 0  Cal ifornia Bui ld ing Code as adopted 
in SBMC Chapter 1 2 . 1 1 5  is intended to replace CMC Chapter 1 ,  D ivis ion I I .  

Note : For administrative purposes, the 201 0 Californ ia Bui ld ing Code app l ies to 
both residential and non-residential mechan ical applications. 

SECTION 2: CALI FORN IA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT EXEMPTION . The C ity 
Counci l  determines that this ordinance is exempt from review under the Cal iforn ia 
Environmental Qual ity Act (Cal ifornia Public Resources Code Section 2 1 000, et seq. , 

A1 0-0028 1  1 



54

"CEOA") and the regu lations promulgated thereunder ( 1 4 Californ ia Code of 
Regu lations Sections 1 5000, et seq. , the "State CEOA Guidel ines") because it consists 
only of m inor revisions and clarifications to an existing code of construction-re lated 
regu lations and specification of procedu res related thereto and will not have the effect of 
deleting or substantial ly changing any regulatory standards or findings requ i red therefor. 
This ord inance, therefore ,  is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the 
environment and that does not have the potential to cause sign ificant effects on the 
environment. 

SECTION 3: SAVINGS CLAUSE.  Repeal o f  any provision of  the SBMC or  any other c ity 
ord inance herein wi l l  not affect any penalty, forfeitu re ,  or l iabi l ity incurred before , or 
preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before , this 
Ord inance's effective date . Any such repealed part wi l l  remain in fu l l  force and effect for 
sustain ing action or prosecuting violations occu rring before the effective date of th is 
Ordinance. 

SECTION 4: EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ord inance wi l l  take effect on the 31 s t  day 
fol lowing its final passage and adoption or January 1 ,  201 1 ,  which ever is latest . 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this __ day of November, 201 0. 

ATTEST: 

Mabi Covarrubias P l isky 
City Clerk 

APPROVED AS TO FORM:  

Ariel Pierr�e 
City Attorney 

A1 0-00281 2 

Bi l l  Fu lton 
Mayor 



55

ORDINANCE NO. 201 0-_ 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY 
REFERENCE THE 201 0 EDITION OF THE 
CALIFORNIA PLU MBING CODE AND AMENDING 
CERTAIN PROVISIONS THEREOF THROUGH 
EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL NECESSITY 

The Counci l of the City of San Buenaventura does ordain as fol lows: 

SECTION 1 :  F IND I NGS. After due consideration , the City Counci l  f inds and determ ines 
that local cl imatic, topographic, and geograph ical conditions exist as fol lows: 

A .  Cl imatic and Geological . The C ity has a l im ited supply of local water 
some of which is corrosive in nature which requ i res modification of p l umbing 
fixtures to conserve water and protect the publ ic health and welfare .  

B .  After due consideration , the C ity Counci l f inds and determines that these 
local c l imatic and geological conditions make modifications and changes to the 
20 1 0  Edition of the California P lumbing Code reasonably necessary to p rovide 
sufficient and effective protection of l ife, health and property. 

SECTION 2: Chapter 1 2 . 1 20 of D ivision 1 2  of the San Buenaventura Municipal Code 
("SBMC") is amended in its enti rety to read as fol lows: 

Plumbing Standards 

Section 1 2. 120.01 0. Adoption of California Plumbing Code, 201 0 Edition. 

Pursuant to Californ ia Government Code sections 50022. 1  to 50022 .8 ,  inc lusive ,  
Part 5 of  Title 24 of the Cal iforn ia Code of  Regulations, known as the Ca l ifo rn ia 
P lumbing Code, 201 0 Edition ("CPC") , includ ing Appendices A, B, D, G, I, K, and L 
thereof, is  adopted by reference subject to the amendments, add itions and delet ions set 
forth in this chapter. The CPC wil l  apply to a l l  occupancies identified by this code .  O ne 
true copy of the CPC is on f i le in the office of the City Clerk and Bui ld ing Official and is 
available for publ ic inspection as requ ired by law 

Section 1 2. 1 20.020. Amendments. 

A. After due consideration , the C ity Counci l f inds and determines that l ocal  
c l imatic, topographic, and geographical conditions exist as fol lows: C l imat ic  and 
Geological .  The City has a l imited supply of local water some of wh ich is 
corrosive in  nature which requ ires mod ification of p lumbing fixtu res to conserve 
water and protect the publ ic health and welfare. 

1 
A1 0-00281 



56

B.  These local c l imatic and geological condit ions make modificat ions and 
changes to the PCP reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective 
protection of l ife , health and property. Therefore , the CPC is modified , amended, 
added to , and changed as set forth below: 

1 .  Section 1 00 is added to read as fol lows: 

1 00. Administrative Coordination of Codes. For the purposes of establ ish ing 
fees, admin istering permits and inspections, processing alternate methods of 
compl iance , hearing appeals, and other local admin istrative purposes,  CPC 
Chapter 1 ,  D ivision I I  is replaced by the 201 0  Cal iforn ia Bu i ld ing Code, C hapter 1 
as adopted in the San Buenaventura Mun icipal Code. 

Note: For admin istrative purposes, the 201 0  Cal iforn ia Bui ld ing Code appl ies to 
both residential and non-residential p lumbing appl ications. 

2. Section 600 is added to read as fol lows: 

600. Sub-Metering Required. San Buenaventura Mun icipal Code sections 
22 . 1 30.01 5, 22 . 1 30 .030, 22 . 1 30.050 requ i re sub-metering domestic water 
suppl ies serving mu lt iple residential and non-residential un its within the same 
bu i lding . Visit www.mun icode.com on the Internet or the City Hal l permit counter 
for copies of these m un icipal code sections .  

3 .  Section 604.2 is amended to read as fol lows: 

604.2. Use Of Copper Tubing. Copper tube for water piping wi l l  have a weight 
of not less than Type L. 

4 .  Section 6 1 1 .5 is added to read as fol lows: 

61 1 .5 Water Softener Loop. Each single-fami ly and multi-fami ly dwe l l in g  un it 
wi l l  have its water d istribution and d rainage system designed to a l low for 
connection to water softener equipment . The connection wi l l  be by means of an 
exposed , readily accessible plumbing loop or by other means approved by the 
administrative authority. The water softener d ischarge wi l l  term inate into an 
approved plumbing receptor. 

EXCEPTION : Apartment un its (excluding condomin iums) with a common water 
meter and common main water l ine.  

5 .  Section 71 3.4. 1 is added to read as fol lows: 

71 3.4.1 Economic Hardship - Sewer System Unavai lable. When the applicant 
seeks to instal l  a new alternate private sewage d isposal system or to 
repair/replace an alternate private sewage d isposal system and the publ ic sewer 

2 
A1 0-00281 



57

is located more than two hundred (200) feet from any property l i ne  and/or 
connection is not available from the sewer service agency, the publ ic sewer may 
be considered as not being avai lable when it has been adequately demonstrated 
to the satisfaction of the Adm inistrative Authority that the total cost of connect ing 
to the publ ic sewer wou ld be at least one and one half times the total cost of the 
alternative private sewage d isposal system .  

6 .  Section 1 01 4 . 1  i s  amended to add the fol lowing sentence at the end of  the 
paragraph: 
Al l approved g rease traps shal l  also meet the requirements of other Department 
and Divisions of the City. 

7. Section 1 1 1 0 is  added to read as fol lows: 

1 1 10.0 General .  The fol lowing  regu latory language is based on the I nternational 
Association of P lumbing and Mechanical Officials ( IAPMO) Green P lumbing & 
Mechanical Code. 

1 1 1 0.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to the construction , 
alteration , and repair of a lternate water source systems for non-potable 
appl ications. 

1 1 10.1 .1 Allowable Use of Alternate Water. Where approved or required by the 
Building Official , alternate water sources; ra i nwater, shal l  be perm itted to be used 
in l ieu of potable water for the appl ications identified in this chapter. 

1 1 1 0.2 System DeSign. Alternate water source systems complying with th is  
chapter shal l be designed by a person reg istered or  l icensed to  perform p lumbing  
design work. Components, piping, and fittings used i n  any alternate water sou rce 
system shal l  be l isted . 

EXCEPTIONS:  

( 1 ) A person registered or l icensed to perform p lumbing design work is not 
required to design rainwater catchment systems u sed for i rrigat ion with a 
maximum storage capacity of 360 gal lons ( 1 ,363 L) . 

(2) A person registered or l icensed to perform plumb ing design work is  not 
required to design rainwater catchment systems for s ing le fam i ly dwe l l i ngs  
where a l l  outlets, piping, and system components are located on  the exterior 
of the bui ld ing . 

1 1 10.3 Permit. It shall be un lawful for any person to construct, instal l ,  a lter, o r  
cause to be constructed , instal led ,  o r  altered any alternate water source system in  

3 
A1 0-00281 



58

a bui lding or on a premise without first obtaining a permit to do such work f rom the 
Bui lding Offic ial .  

EXCEPTIONS: 

(1 ) A permit is  not requ i red for exterior rainwater catchment systems u sed for 
outdoor drip and subsurface i rrigation with a maximum storage capacity of 360 
gallons ( 1 ,363 L) . 

(2) A plumbing permit is not required for rainwater catchment systems fo r s i ng le 
fam i ly dwe l l i ngs where a l l  outlets, p ip ing ,  and system compone nts are 
located on the exterior of the bu i ld ing .  Th is  does not exempt the n eed for 
permits if required for electrical connections, tank supports, or enclosure s .  

1 1 10.4 Component Identification. System components shall be properly identified 
as to the manufacturer. 

1 1 10.5 Maintenance and Inspection. Altemate water source systems and 
components shall be inspected and maintained in accordance with Section 
1 1 1 0.5 . 1  th rough Section 1 1 1 0 .5 .3 .  

1 1 1 0.5.1 Frequency. Alternate water source systems and components shal l  be 
inspected and maintained in accordance with Table 1 1 1 0 .5  un less  more 
frequent inspection and maintenance is required by the manufacturer. 

1 1 10.5.2 Maintenance Log. A maintenance log for rainwater is required to h ave a 
permit in accordance with Section 1 1 1 0.3  and shall be maintained by the p roperty 
owner and be available for inspection . The property owner or designated appointee 
shall ensure that a record of testing, inspection and maintenance as requ i red by 
Table 1 1 1 0 .5 is maintained in the log. The log wi l l  indicate the frequ e n cy of 
inspection and maintenance for each system.  

1 1 10.5.3 Maintenance Responsibility. The required maintenance and inspect ion of 
alternate water source systems shall be the responsibil ity of the property owner, 
un less otherwise required by the Building Official. 

1 1 10.6 Operation and Maintenance Manual. An operation and maintenance manual 
for rainwater systems required to have a permit in accordance with S ection 
1 1 1 0 .3 shal l  be supp l ied to the bu i ld ing owner by the system design e r. The 
o perating and maintenance manual shal l  i nclude the fol lowing: 
( 1 ) Detai led d iagram of the entire system and the location of system components . 

(2) Instructions on operating and maintain ing the system .  

4 
A1 0-00281 



59

(3) Detai ls on maintain ing the requ i red water qua l ity as determined by the 
Bui ld ing Official . 

(4) Detai ls on deactivat ing the system for m aintenance, repai r, o r  other 
purposes. 

(5) Applicable testing, inspection ,  and maintenance frequencies as req u i red by 
Table 1 1 1 0 .5 .  

(6) A method of contacting the manufacturer(s) . 

1 1 10.7 Minimum Water Quality Requirements. The minimum water qual ity for 
alternate water source systems shall meet the applicable water quality requi rements 
for the intended appl ication as determined by the publ ic health Authority Having 
Jurisdiction . In  the absence of water quality requirements, the EPAl625/R-04/1 08 
contains recommended water reuse guidelines to assist regu latory agencies 
develop, revise, or expand alternate water source wat�r qual ity standards. 

5 
A1 0-00281 



60

TAB LE 1 1 1 0.5 

MINIMUM ALTERNATE WATER SOURCE TESTING, INSPECTION, AND MAINTENANCE 

FREQUENCY 

DESCRIPTION M IN IMUM FREQUENCY 
Inspect and clean fi lters and screens, and replace ( if Every 3 months 

necessary) 

In accordance with manufactu rer's instructions, 

Inspect and verify that disinfection, f i lters and water qual ity and the Authority Having Jurisd iction 

treatment devices and systems are operational and 
maintain ing minimum water quality requ i rements as 

determined by the Authority Having Ju risd iction 

Inspect and clear debris f rom rain- water gutters, Every 6 months 
downspouts, and roof washers 

Inspect and clear debris from roof or other aboveground Every 6 months 
rainwater col lection surfaces 

Remove tree branches and vegetation overhanging roof As needed 
or other aboveground rainwater collection surfaces 

I nspect pumps and verify operation After in itial installation and every 1 2  months 
thereafter 

Inspect valves and verify operation After in itial instal lation and every 1 2  months 
thereafter 

Inspect pressure tanks and verify operation 
After initial installation and every 1 2  months 

thereafter 

Clear debris from and inspect storage tanks, locking 
After in itial installation and every 1 2  months 

devices, and verify operation 
thereafter 

Inspect caution labels and marking After initial installation and every 1 2  months 
thereafter 

Inspect and maintain mulch basins for g ray water 
As needed to maintain mulch depth and irrigation systems 

prevent ponding and runoff 

Cross-connection inspection and test* 
After in itial instal lation and every 1 2  months 

thereafter 

* The cross-connection test shal l  be performed in  the presence of the Authority 
Having Jurisdiction in accordance with the requi rements of this Chapter. 

EXCEPTIONS: 

(1 ) Water treatment is not required for rainwater catchment systems used for 
aboveground i rrigation with a maximum storage capacity of 360 gal lons 
( 1 363 L) . 

(2) Water treatment is not required for rainwater catchment systems used for 
subsurface or drip  i rrigation . 

6 
A1 0-00281 



61

1 1 10.8 Material Compatibil ity. Alternate water source systems shall be constructed 
of materials that are compatible with the type of pipe and fitt ing materials ,  water 
treatment, and water cond itions in the system .  

1 1 10.9 System Controls. Controls for pumps, valves, and other devices that contain 
mercury that come in contact with alternate water source water supply sha l l  not be 
permitted . 

8 .  Section 1 1 1 1  is added to read as fol lows: 

1 1 1 1 .0 Non-Potable Rainwater Catchment Systems. The fol lowing regulatory 

language is based largely on the International Association of P lumbing and 

Mechan ical Officials ( IAPMO) Green Plumbing & Mechanical Code. 

1 1 1 1 .1 General. The provisions of this section shall apply to the instal lation ,  
construction , alteration , and repair o f  rainwater catchments systems intended to 
supply uses such as water closets, urinals, trap primers for floor drains and floor 
sinks, irrigation , industrial processes, water features, cool ing tower make up  and 
other uses approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction . Additiona l  design 
criteria can be found in the ARC SAl ASPE Rainwater Catchment Design and 
Instal lation Standard . 

1 1 1 1 .2 Plumbing Plan Submission. No permit for any rainwater catchment system 
requiring a permit shall be issued until complete plumbing plans, with appropriate 
data satisfactory to the Building Official , have been submitted and approved. No 
changes or connections shall be made to either the rainwater catchment or the 
potable water system within any site contain ing a rainwater catchment water system 
without approval by the Authority Having Jurisdiction . 

1 1 1 1 .3 System Changes. No changes or connections shall be made to either the 
rainwater catchment system or the potable water system within any site contain ing 
a rainwater catchment system requiring a permit without approval by the B ui ld ing 
Officia l .  

1 1 1 1 .4 Connections to Potable or Reclaimed (Recycled) Water Systems. Rainwater 
catchment systems shall have no direct connection to any potable water supply or 
alternate water source system .  Potable or reclaimed (recycled) water is permitted to 
be used as makeup water for a rainwater catchment system provided the potable or 
reclaimed (recycled) water supply connection is protected by an air gap or 
reduced-pressure principle backflow prevention device in accordance with the 
plumbing code. 

1 1 1 1 .5 Initial Cross-Connection Test. Where any portion of a rainwater catchment 
system is instal led within a bui lding, a cross-connect ion test is requ i red  in  

7 
A1 0-00281  



62

accordance with 1 1 1 1 . 1 1 .2 .  Before the bui lding is occupied or the system is 
activated, the instal ler shal l perform the initial cross-connection test in the presence 
of the Authority Having Jurisdiction . The test shal l  be ruled successfu l by the 
Bui lding Official before final  approval is granted . 

1 1 1 1 .6 Sizing. Rainwater catchment system d istribution piping for indoor 
applications shall be sized as outlined in this supplement for sizing potabl e  water 
piping. The design and size of rainwater drains, gutters, conductors, and leaders 
shall be in accordance with the plumbing code. 

1 1 1 1 .7 Rainwater Catchment System Materials. Rainwater catchment system 
materials shall be in accordance with Section 1 1 1 1 .7 . 1 th rough Section 1 1 1 1 .7 .4.  

1 1 1 1 .7.1 Water Supply and Distribution Materials. Rainwater catchment water 
supply and d istribution materials shall comply with the requirements of the p lumbing 
code for potable water supply and distribution systems,  un less otherwise provided 
for in this section . 

1 1 1 1 .7.2 Rainwater Catchment System Drainage Materials. Materials used in 
rainwater catchment d rainage systems ,  inc lud ing gutters ,  downspouts , 
conductors, and leaders shal l comply with the requirements of the p lumbing code 
for storm drainage. 

1 1 1 1 .7.3 Storage Tanks. Rainwater storage tanks shal l be in accordance with 
Section 1 1 1 1 .9 .5 .  

1 1 1 1 .7.4 Collection Surfaces. The collection surface shal l  be constructed of a hard ,  
impervious materia l .  

1 1 1 1 .8 Rainwater Catchment Water System Color and Marking Information. 
Rainwater catchment systems shall have a colored background in  accordance with 
the p lumbing code .  Rainwater catchment systems shal l  be marked, in lettering 
in accordance with the plumbing code, with the words: "CAUTION: NON-POTABLE 
RAINWATER WATER, DO NOT DRINK." 

1 1 1 1 .9 Design and Instal lation. 

1 1 1 1 .9.1 Outside Hose Bibs. Outside hose bibs shal l  be al lowed on rainwater 
piping systems. Hose bibs supplying rainwater sha l l  be marked with the words: 
"CAUTION:  NON-POTABLE WATER ,  DO NOT DRI N K" and the symbol in Figu re 
503.9. 

1 1 1 1 .9.2 Deactivation and Drainage for Cross-connection Test. The rainwater 
catchment system and the potable water system within the bui ld ing shal l  be 
provided with the requ ired appurtenances (e.g . ,  valves, air or  vacuum rel ief 

8 
A1 0-00281 



63

valves, etc. )  to al low for deactivation or d rainage as requ i red fo r c ross­
connection test in Section 1 1 1 1 . 1 1 .2 .  

1 1 1 1 .9.3 Collection Surfaces. Rainwater shall be  co l lected from roof s u rfaces .  
Ra inwater catchment system shal l not col lect rainwater from: 

(1 ) Vehicu lar parking surfaces. 

(2) Surface water runoff . 

(3) Bodies of standing water. 

1 1 1 1 .9.3.1 Prohibited Discharges. Overflows and bleed-off pipes from roof­
mounted equipment and appliances shall not discharge onto roof surfaces that are 
intended to col lect rainwater. 

1 1 1 1 .9.4 Minimum Water Quality. The minimum water qual ity for harvested 
rainwater shal l  meet the appl icable water qual ity requ i rements for the intended 
applications as determined by the Bui lding Official . No treatment is requi red for 
rainwater used for subsurface or non-sprinkled surface irrigation where the 
m aximum storage volume is less than 360 gallons ( 1 , 363 L) . 

1 1 1 1 .9.5 Rainwater Storage Tanks. Rainwater storage tanks shall be constructed 
and instal led in accordance with Section 1 1 1 1 .9 .5 . 1  th rough Section 1 1 1 1 .9 .5 .7 .  

1 1 1 1 .9.5.1 Construction. Rainwater storage shal l be constructed of sol id , du rable 
materials not subject to excessive corrosion or decay and shal l  be watert ight .  
Storage tanks sha l l  be approved by the Bui lding Official , provided such tanks 
comply with approved appl icable standards. 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.2 Location. Rainwater storage tanks shall be perm itted to be i nstal led 
above or below grade. 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.3 Above Grade. Above grade storage tanks shal l  be of an opaque  
material , approved for above-ground use in d i rect sun l ight o r  shal l  be sh ie lded  
from d i rect sun l ight .  Tanks shal l  be  instal led in an accessib le location to a l low 
for inspection and cleaning. The tank shal l be instal led on a foundation or  
p latform that i s  constructed to accommodate a l l  loads in  accordance w i th  the  
bu i ld ing code. 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.4 Below Grade. Rainwater storage tanks instal led below grade sha l l  be  
structural ly designed to  withstand al l anticipated earth or other loads. Holdi n g  tank 
covers shal l  be capable of supporting an earth load of not less than 300 pou nds 
per square foot ( lblft2) ( 1 ,465 kg/m

2
) when the tank is designed for underg round 

instal lation . Below grade rainwater tanks instal led underground shal l  be provid ed 
with manholes. The manhole opening shall be located a min imum of 4 inches  ( 1 02 
mm) above the surrounding grade. The surrounding grade shall be sloped away 

9 
A1 0-00281 



64

from the manhole. Underground tanks shal l  be bal lasted , anchored , or otherwise 
secured, to prevent the tan k  from floating out of the g round when empty. The 
combined weight of the tank and hold down system should meet or exceed the 
buoyancy force of the tank. 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.5 Drainage and Overflow. Rainwater storage tanks shal l  be provided with 
a means of drain ing and clean ing . The overflow drain shal l  not be equ i pped with 
a shutoff valve. The overf low outlet shal l  d ischarge as required by the p lumbing 
code for storm drainage systems. Where discharging to the storm d rainage 
system , the overf low dra in shal l be p rotected from backflow of the sto rm 
d ra inage system by a backwater valve o r  other approved method . 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.5.1 Overflow Outlet Size. The overflow out let shal l be s ized to 
accommodate the flow of the rainwater entering the tank and not less than the 
aggregate cross-sectional area of a l l  inflow pipes . 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.6 Opening and Access Protection. 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.6.1 Animals and Insects. Rainwater tank openings shall be protected to 
prevent the entrance of insects, birds, or rodents into the tank. 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.6.2 Human Access. Rainwater tank access openings exceeding 1 2  inches 
(305 mm) i n  d i am ete r s h a l l  be s ec u re d  to p reve nt  tampering  and  
un intended entry by  either a lockable device or other approved method . 

1 1 1 1 .9.5.7 Marking. Rainwater tanks shal l be permanently marked with the 
capacity and the language: "NON-POTABLE RAINWATER." Where open ings are 
provided to al low a person to enter the tank, the opening shall be marked with the 
fol lowing language: "DANGE R-CONFINED SPACE." 

1 1 1 1 .9.6 Pumps. Pumps serving rainwater catchment systems shall be l isted . 
Pumps supplying water to water closets, urinals, and trap primers shal l  be 
capable of del ivering not less than 1 5  psi ( 1 03 kPa) residual pressu re at the 
highest and most remote outlet served . Where the water pressure in the rainwater 
supply system within the bui lding exceeds 80 psi (552 kPa) , a pressure reducing 
valve reducing the pressure to 80 psi (552 kPa) or less to al l  water outlets in the 
bui lding shal l  be installed in accordance with the plumbing code. 

1 1 1 1 .9.7 Roof Drains. Primary and secondary roof drains, conductors ,  leaders ,  
and gutters shall be designed and instal led in accordance with the p lumbing code .  

1 1 1 1 .9.8 Water Quality Devices and Equipment. Devices and equ ipment u sed to  
treat rainwater to  maintain the minimum water quality requirements determined by  
the bui lding official , shal l be  l isted or  labeled (th ird-party certified) by  a l ist ing 

1 0  
A1 0-00281 



65

agency (accredited conformity assessment body) and approved for the i ntended 
appl ication .  

1 1 1 1 .9.9 Freeze Protection. Tanks and piping instal led in locations subject to 
freezing shal l be provided with an adequate means of freeze protection . 

1 1 1 1 .9.1 0 Debris Removal. The rainwater catchment conveyance system sha l l  be 
equ ipped with a debris exc luder or other approved means to prevent the accu­
m u lation of leaves, needles , other debris and sed iment from entering the 
storage tank. Devices or methods used to remove debris or sed iment sha l l  be 
accessib le and sized and installed in accordance with manufacturer's instal lation 
instructions. 

1 1 1 1 .9.1 1 Required Filters. A filter permitting the passage of particulates no larger 
than 1 00 microns ( 1 00 11m) shall be provided for rainwater suppl ied to water 
closets, urinals, trap primers,  and drip i rrigation system .  

1 1 1 1 .9.1 2 Roof Gutters. G utters shal l maintain a m in imum slope and  be  s ized 
in  accordance with the p lumbing code. 

1 1 1 1 .1 0  Signs. Signs in bui ldings using rainwater water shal l  be in accordance with 
Section 1 1 1 1 . 1 0. 1  and Section 1 1 1 1 . 1 0.2.  

1 1 1 1 .10.1 Commercial, Industrial, and Institutional Restroom Signs. A sign shal l  be 
installed in all restrooms in commercial , industrial , and institutional occupancies 
using non-potable rainwater for water closets, urinals or both . Each sign shal l contain 
V2-inch ( 1 2.7 mm) letters of a highly visible color on a contrasting background .  The 
location of the sign(s) shal l  be such that the sign(s) shal l be visible to al l  users .  The 
number and location of the signs shall be approved by the Bui lding Official and shal l  
contain the fol lowing text: TO CONSERVE WATER,  TH I S  BU ILD ING USES 
RAINWATER TO FLUSH TOILETS AND U RINALS. 

1 1 1 1 .10.2 Equipment Room Signs. Each equipment room containing non-potable 
rainwater equipment shal l  have a sign posted with the fol lowing wording in 1 inch 
(25.4 mm) letters : 

CAUTION NON-POTABLE RAINWATER, DO NOT DRINK. DO NOT CON N ECT 
TO DRINKING WATER SYSTEM. NOTICE: CONTACT BUILDING MANAGE MENT 
BEFORE PERFORMING ANY WORK ON THIS WATER SYSTEM .  

This sign shall be posted i n  a location that i s  visible to anyone working o n  o r  near 
rainwater water equipment. 

1 1 1 1 .1 1 Inspection and Testing. Rainwater catchment systems shall be inspected 
and tested in accordance with Section 1 1 1 1 . 1 1 . 1 through Section 1 1 1 1 . 1 1 .2 .  

1 1  
A1 0-00281 



66

1 1 1 1 .1 1 .1 Supply System Inspection and Test Rainwater catchment s ystems 
shall be inspected and tested in accordance with the applicable provisions of the 
p lumbing code for testing of potable water and storm drainage systems. 

1 1 1 1 .1 1 .2 Annual Cross-Connection Inspection and Testing. An in it ia l  and 
subsequent annual inspect ion and test requ i red by Section 1 1 1 1 .5 sha l l  be 
performed on both the potable and rainwater catchment water systems.  The 
potable and rainwater catchm ent water system shall be isolated from each other 
and independently inspected and tested to ensu re there is no cross-connection 
in accordance with Section 1 1 1 1 . 1 1 .2 . 1  through Section 1 1 1 1  . 1 1 .2 .4 .  

1 1 1 1 .1 1 .2.1 Visual System Inspection. Prior to commencing the cross-con nection 
testing, a dual system inspection shal l  be conducted by the Building Official and 
other authorities having jurisd ict ion as fol lows: 

(1 ) Pumps, equipment , equ ipment room signs, and exposed p ip in g  in 
equipment room shal l  be checked. 

1 1 1 1 .1 1 .2.2 Cross-Connection Test. The procedure for determ in ing  c ross­
connection sha l l  be fol lowed by the applicant in the presence of the Building 
Official and other authorities having jurisdiction to determ ine whether a cross­
connection has occurred as fol lows: 

A1 0-00281 

( 1 ) The potable water system shal l be activated and pressu ri ze d .  Th 
rainwater catchment water system sha l l  be shut  down and com p l etely 
drained . The potable water system shall remain pressurized for a 
m in imum period of t ime specified by the Bu i ld ing Official wh i l e  the 
rainwater catchment water system is empty. The minimum period the 
rainwater catchment water system is to remain depressu rized shal l  be 
determined on a case-by-case basis, taking into account the size and 
complexity of the potable and rainwater catchment water d ist ri b ution 
systems, but in no case shall that period be less than 1 hour. 

(2) Fixtures , potable and rainwater shal l be tested and inspected for f low. 
F low from any rainwater catchment water system outlet shal l not indicate a 
cross-connection . No flow from a potable water outlet shal l indicate that it is 
be connected to the rainwater water system .  

(3) The drain on  the rainwater catchment water system shall be  checked for 
flow during the test and at the end of the period . 

(4) The potable water system shal l  then be completely drained. 

1 2  



67

(5) The rainwater catchment water system shal l then be activated and 
p ressurized. 

(6) The rainwater catchment water system shal l  remain pressurized for a 
m in imum period of time specified by the Bui lding Official while the potable 
water system is empty. The min imum period the potable water system is to 
remain depressu rized shal l be determined on a case-by-case basis ,  but in 
no case shall that period be less than 1 hour. 

(7) Fixtures, potable and rainwater catchment, shal l be tested and inspected 
for flow. Flow from any potable water system outlet shall not indicate a cross­
connection . No flow from a rainwater catchment water outlet shal l  ind icate 
that it is connected to the potable water system .  

(8) The drain o n  the potable water system shal l be checked for flow during the 
test and at the end of the period . 

(9) If there is no flow detected in any of the fixtures which wou ld indicate a 
cross-connection , the potable water system shall be repressurized . 

1 1 1 1 .1 1 .2.3 Discovery of Cross-Connection. In  the event that a cross-connection 
is discovered, the fol lowing procedu re ,  in the presence of the Bu i ld ing Official , 
shall be activated immediately: 

( 1 ) Rainwater catchment water p ip ing to the bu i ld ing shall be shut down at 
the meter, and the rainwater water riser shal l be drained. 

(2) Potable water piping to the bu i ld ing shal l be shut down at the meter. 

(3) The cross-connection shal l be uncovered and d isconnected . 

(4) The bui ld ing shall be retested fol lowing procedures l isted in Section 
1 1 1 1 . 1 1 .2 . 1  and Section 1 1 1 1 . 1 1 .2 .2 .  

(5) The potable water system shall be chlorinated with 50 ppm ch lorine for  24 
hours .  

(6) The potable water system shall be f lushed after 24 hou rs ,  and a standard 
bacterio log ical test shall be performed. If test results are acceptable , the 
potable water system shal l  be perm itted to be recharged . 

1 1 1 1 .1 1 .2.4 Annual Inspection. An annual inspection of the rainwater catchment 
water system, fol lowing the procedures listed in Section 1 1 1 1 . 1 1 .2 . 1  shal l be 
required. Annual cross-connection testing, fol lowing the procedures l isted in Section 
1 1 1 1 . 1 1 .2 .2 shal l  be requ ired by the Bui ld ing Officia l ,  un less site conditions do not 

1 3  
A1 0-00281  



68

require it. In no event shal l the test occur less than once in 4 years. A l t e rn ate 
test i ng  req u i rem ents sha l l be  permitted by the Bui ld ing Official 

9. Section K1 .0 (A) of Append ix K is amended to read as fol lows: 

a. Where permitted by Section 71 3.0, the bui lding sewer shal l  be permitted 
to be connected to a private sewage d isposal system complying with the 
provisions of this appendix. The type of system shal l  be determ ined on the 
basis of information contained in the soil report concerning locat ion ,  soi l 
porosity, and ground water level ,  and shal l  be designed to receive a l l  
sewage from the property. The soi ls report shal l be performed u nder the 
supervision of a Californ ia - registered environmental health special ist , 
C ivi l  Engineer, Geologist ,  or  Eng ineering Geologist. The system , except 
as other wise approved, shal l  consist of a septic tank with eff luent 
d ischarging into a subsurface disposal fie ld ,  into ( 1 ) or more seepage pits , 
or into a combination of subsurface d isposal field and seepage p its. The 
Bu i ld ing Official shal l  be perm itted to grant exceptions to the provi sions of 
this appendix for permitted structures that have been destroyed d u e  to f ire 
or natural d isaster and that cannot be reconstructed in compl iance with 
these provisions provided that such exceptions are the m in imum 
necessary. 

1 0 . Section K4.0 (A) and (B) of Append ix K are amended to read as fol lows: 

(A) Disposal field and seepage pits shal l be sized in accordance with the 
percolation test or analyses required by subsection (B) of th is section . 

(B) In  order to determine the absorption qual ities of soi ls ,  the proposed 
site shal l  be subjected to percolat ion test and/ or hydrometer analyses 
performed under the supervision of a Cal iforn ia- reg i stered 
environmental health special ist ,  C ivi l Engineer, Geolog ist or 
Engineering Geologist .  The Bui ld ing Official shal l  approve such test 
that meet recognized standards at their  discretion . 

1 1 .  Section KB.O is deleted entirely. 

1 2 . Section K9.0 (H) of Appendix K is added to read as fol lows: 

(H) The discharge of industrial waste into a soi l absorption system shal l  be 
proh ibited un less specif ical ly approved by the Bu i ld ing Officia l .  

SECTION 3: CALIFORNIA ENVI RONMENTAL QUALITY ACT EXEM PTION . The City 
Council determines that th is ordinance is exempt from review under the Ca l iforn ia 
Environmental Qual ity Act (Cal iforn ia Publ ic Resources Code §§ 2 1 000, et seq. , 
"CEQA") and the regulations promu lgated thereunder ( 1 4 Cal iforn ia Code of 
Regulat ions §§ 1 5000, et seq. , the "State CEQA Guidel ines") because it consists on ly of 

1 4  
A1 0-00281 



69

m inor revisions and clarifications to an existing code of construction-related reg ulations 
and specification of procedures related thereto and wi l l  not have the effect of de leting or 
substantially changing any regu latory standards or f indings requ i red therefor. This 
ord inance , therefore , is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the 
environment and that does not have the potential to cause sign ificant effects on the 
environment. 

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE.  Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or  any other c ity 
ord inance herein will not affect any penalty, forfeitu re, or l iabi l ity incu rred b efore ,  or  
preclude prosecution and imposition of  penalties for any violation occurring  before, th is 
Ordinance's effective date . Any such repealed part wi l l  remain in fu l l  force and effect for 
sustain ing action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date of th is 
Ord inance . 

SECTION 5 :  SEVERAB ILITY. If any part of th is Ordinance is deemed inval id by a cou rt  
of competent jurisd iction , the city counci l  intends that such decision wi" not affect the 
val id ity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance and ,  to this end , the provision s  of th is 
Ord inance are severable. 

SECTION 6 :  VALI D ITY OF PREVIOUS CODE SECTIONS. If th is enti re Ord inance is 
repealed or is deemed invalid by a court of competent ju risdiction , such action wi l l  
render this Ord inance void and cause such SBMC Ordinance previously i n  effect p rior 
to amendment by this Ordinance to remain in fu l l  force and effect for al l  purposes .  

SECTIO N  7 :  EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance wil l  take effect on the 3 1  st day 
fol lowing its final passage and adoption or on January 1 , 20 1 1 ,  which ever is  later. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _day of November 20 1 0 . 

ATTEST: 

Mabi Covarrubias P l isky 
City Clerk 

APPROVE�:O FORM:  

Ariel Pierre Calonne 
City Attorney 

A1 0-00281 

Bi l l  Fu lton , Mayor 

1 5  



70

THIS PAGE I NTENTIONALLY LEFT B LAN K 



71

ORDINANCE NO. 201 0-_ 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
SAN BUENAVENTURA ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 
201 0  EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL 
CODE AND AMENDING CERTAIN PROVISIONS 
THEREOF THROUGH EXPRESS FINDINGS OF LOCAL 
NECESSITY 

The Counci l  of the City of San Buenaventura does ordain as fol lows: 

SECTIO N  1 :  F IND INGS.  The City Counci l  f inds that certain local c l imatic, geological , or  
topographical conditions exist as fol lows: 

A.  C l imatic. The C ity experiences periods of h igh temperatures accompan ied 
by low humid ity and h igh winds each year. These conditions cou ld c reate an 
environment in  which the f ire department may have great d ifficu lty in control l ing 
f ires occurring in h i l lside brush areas as wel l  as structures not having bU i lt-in  f ire 
protection . The City also experiences periods of intense rainfal l ,  which cre ate the 
need for special drainage precautions. 

B .  Geological .  The City is located in  an area with expansive so i ls  and 
includes h i l lsides that are subject to mudflows and unstable conditions. S pecial 
foundation considerations and soi ls analyses requ i rements must be in p lace to 
provide a reasonable degree of structural integrity for bui ldi ngs constructed in  
these areas. Several earthquake fau lts run th rough the City that ,  when active , 
wi l l  impose un ique lateral loads on structures in the City. Specia l  l atera l  
structu ral design criteria are needed to resist these lateral  loads imposed by 
active earthquake fau lts in the City. 

C. Topographical .  The City has h i l lside and flat land developments that 
require special drainage precautions, as wel l  as a system of roadways and 
h ighways that generate traffic noise . Structures wou ld be subject to water 
damage without special requ irements addressing site drainage. 

D. After due consideration , the City Counci l  f inds and determines that these 
local c l imatic, geological , and topographical cond itions make modifications  and 
changes to the 201 0  Edition of the Cal iforn ia Residential Code reasonably 
necessary to provide sufficient and effective protection of l ife , health , and 
property. 

SECTION 2 :  Chapter 1 2 . 1 1 0  of  Division 1 2  of  the San Buenaventura Mun icipal Code 
("SBMC") is amended in its enti rety to read as fol lows: 

1 
A1 0-0028 1  



72

Residential Bu i ld ing Standards 

Section 1 2 . 1 1 0 .0 1 0 . Adoption of Cal ifornia Residential Code, 20 1 0  Edition .  

Pursuant to Cal ifornia Government Code sections 50022 . 1  to 50022 .8 ,  i nclusive , 
Part 2 . 5  of Title 24 of the Cal iforn ia Code of Regu lations, known as the Cal iforn ia 
Residential Code, 20 1 0  Edition ("CRC") ,  inc luding all standard printed Chapters and 
Sections (whether adopted by the State matrix or not) ,  is  adopted by reference subject 
to the amendments, add itions, and deletions set forth in  this chapter. The C RC wil l  
apply to  residential  occupancies identified by this code .  One true copy of the CRC is on  
fi le i n  the office of the City Clerk and Bu i ld ing Official and is avai lable for pub l ic 
inspection as requ i red by law. 

Section 1 2 . 1 1 0 .020 . Amendments . 

A .  The city counci l finds that certain local cl imatic, geological , and/o r  
topographical cond itions exist as  fol lows: 

1 .  Cl imatic. The City experiences periods of high temperatu res accompan ied 
by low humidity and h igh winds each year. These cond itions cou ld create 
an environment in which the f i re department may have g reat difficu lty i n  
contro l l ing fires occurring in h i l ls ide brush areas as  wel l  as structu res not 
having bui lt-in fire protection. The city also experiences periods of intense 
rainfa l l , wh ich create the need for special d rainage precautions. 

2 .  Geolog ical .  The City i s  located in an  a rea with expansive so i ls and 
includes hi l lsides that are subject to mudflows and unstable cond itions .  
Special foundation considerations and soi ls analyses requ irements m ust 
be i n  place to provide a reasonable degree of structural  integrity for 
bui ld ings constructed in these areas. Several earthquake fau lts run 
through the City that, when active, wi l l  impose unique lateral loads  on  
structu res in the City. Special  l ateral  structural  design criteria are needed 
to resist these lateral  loads imposed by active earthquake faults in the 
City. 

3.  Topographica l .  The City has h i l lside and flat land d evelopments that 
requ i re special d ra inage precautions, as wel l  as a system of roadways a nd 
highways that generate traffic noise. Structures wou ld be subject to water 
damage without special requ i rements add ressing site d ra inage. 

B. After due consideration, the city counci l finds and determines that these 
local cl imatic, geolog ica l ,  and topographical  conditions make mod ifications a nd 
changes to the CRC reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective 
protection of l ife, health , and property. The CRC is therefore modified , amended ,  
added to , and changed as set forth below: 

1 .  Chapter 1 ,  Section R1 02 .7, is amended to read as fol lows: 

2 
A1 0-00281 



73

R1 02 . 7  Property Maintenance. The provisions of the most recently adopted 
Ventura C ity P roperty Maintenance Code (Article 6 of Chapter 1 2 .31 0 of Division  1 2  of 
the San Buenaventura Municipal Code , as amended)  sha l l  apply to existing structures 
and premises; equipment and faci l it ies ; l ight, venti lation ,  space heating , sanitation ,  l i fe 
and fire safety hazards; responsib i l it ies of owners, operators, and occupants; and 
occupancy of exist ing prem ises and structures. 

2 .  Section R1 02 .8 i s  added to read a s  fo l lows: 

R1 02.8 Post-Damage Assessment. 

R1 02 .8 . 1  Adoption and I ntent. This section establ ishes regu lat ions as 
amendments to the bui ld ing code for the exped itious assessment and marking of 
damaged structures. This section a lso establishes standard placards to be used to 
indicate the cond ition of a structure for continued occupancy. The section further 
authorizes the Bui ld ing Official and his or her authorized representatives to post the 
appropriate placard at each entry point to a bui ld ing or  structure upon completion of a 
safety assessment. 

R1 02 .8.2 Definitions. For the purposes of th is section , the fol lowing d efin it ion 
appl ies: 

R1 02 .8 .3 Safety Assessment means a visual , non-destructive examinat ion of a 
bui lding or structure for the purpose of determining the condition for continued 
occupancy. 

R1 02 .8 .4 Placards.  

R1 02 .8.4 . 1 Descriptions. The fol lowing are verbal descriptions of the official  
jurisd iction placards to be used to designate the cond ition for continued occupancy of 
bui ld ings or structures. 
( 1 ) I NSPECTED - Lawful Occupancy Permitted is to be posted on any bui ld ing o r  
structure wherein n o  apparent structura l  hazard has been found. This placard is  not 
intended to mean that there is no damage to the bui ld ing or structure .  
(2)  RESTRICTED USE is to be posted on each bui lding or structure that has been 
damaged wherein the damage has resulted in some form of restriction to the continued 
occupancy. The ind ividual who posts this placard wi l l  note in general terms the type of 
damage encountered and wi l l  clearly and concisely note the restrictions on continued 
occupancy. 
(3) UNSAFE - Do Not Enter or Occupy is to be posted on each building or structure that 
has been damaged such that continued occupancy poses a threat to l ife safety. 
Bui ld ings or structures posted with this p lacard shal l  not be entered under any 
circumstance except as authorized in writing by the Bui ld ing Officia l ,  or  h is o r  her 
authorized representative. Safety assessment teams shal l  be authorized to enter these 
bui ldings at any t ime. This placard is not to be used or considered as a demol it ion order. 

3 
A1 0-00281 



74

The individual who posts this placard wi l l  note in general terms the type of damage 
encountered . 

R 1 02.8 .4 .2 Reference. Th is ord inance number, the name of the jurisd ict ion , its 
address, and phone number shal l be permanently affixed to each placard . 

R1 02 .8.4.3 Removal of P lacards. Once it has been attached to a b u i ld ing or  
structure ,  a placard is  not to  be removed , altered or covered unti l  done so by an 
authorized representative of  the Bu i ld ing Official . I t  shal l  be un lawfu l  for any person , f i rm 
or corporation to alter, remove, cover or deface a p lacard un less authorized pu rsuant to 
th is section . 

3 .  Section R 1 03 .3  i s  amended to  read as fol lows: 

R1 03.3 Deputies . I n  accordance with the prescribed procedures of th is 
ju risdiction and with the concu rrence of the appointing authority, the Bui ld ing Official 
shall have the authority to appoint a Deputy Bu i ld ing Officia l ,  the related techn ical 
officers, inspectors, plan examiners and other employees. Such employees shall have 
powers as delegated by the Bu i ld ing Official . 

4 .  Section R1 04.5 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R1 04.5 I dentification . The Bui lding Officia l ,  and his/her representatives ,  shal l  
carry and display, in a readi ly visible location , C ity identification that shows the City, 
Department, D ivision , employee name, and employee rank at all t imes while conduct ing 
City business . 

5. Section R1 05 .2  Item 1 is amended as fol lows: 

1 )  A one-story detached accessory bu i ld ing used as a tool and/or storage  
shed , p layhouse or simi lar use, provided i t  meets the following: 

a .  1 20 sq . ft. maximum floor area. 
b .  8 feet maximum top plate height. 
c. 4: 1 2  maximum pitch roof. 
d .  Has no regu lated plumbing or e lectrical o r  mechanical equipment. 
e .  I s  located in a residential zone. 
f. No more than one such structure per lot. 

6. Section R1 05 .2 Item 2 is amended as fol lows: 

2) Residential fences of wood, chain l ink or s imi lar materials that are not more 
than 6 foot in height from grade as defined in  th is code. 

7. Section R 1 05.2 Item 5 is amended as fol lows: 

4 
A1 0-00281  



75

8. 5) Residential sidewalks and residential driveways not more than 30 inches 
above grade and not over any basement or story, and not part of a required Accessible 
Route of Travel as defined in this code. 

Section R 1 05 .2 Mechanica l :  Item 7 is amended to read as fol lows: 

7) National ly l isted p lug and cord , self-contained , refrigeration systems of 1 
horsepower or less . 

9 .  Section R1 05 .2 . 1 is  amended to read as fol lows: 

1 05.2 . 1 In  emergency situations, where emergency equipment replacement or 
repair m ust be performed, the person who performs the emergency work sha l l  make 
permit appl ication for the emergency work with in one working business day fo l lowing 
the emergency replacement or repair . 

1 0 . Section R 1 05 .3 Item 4 is amended to read as fol lows: 

4) Be accompanied by construction documents, fees,  and other information as 
requ i red by sections R 1 06, R 1 08 and R 1 09 of this code. 

1 1 . Section R1  05 .3 Item 8 is added to read as fol lows: 

8) Have obtained P lanning Division approval to make application for b u i ld ing 
permit . 

1 2 . Section R1  05.3 Item 9 is added to read as fol lows: 

9) Be f i led by appropriate state-l icensed contractors or their authorized 
representatives, except for work on 1 -2 un it dwel l ings, including structures 
accessory thereto ,  which may be filed by owner bui lders when approved by the 
Bui lding Official . 

1 3. Section R 1 05 .5 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R 1 05.5 Expi ration of Perm it .  Every permit issued by the Bui ld ing Offic ia l  under 
the provisions of this Code wi l l  expi re by l im itation and become nul l  and void , i f  the 
bui lding or work authorized by such perm it is not com menced: 

A1 0-00281  

a. with in six (6)  months after the date such perm it was issued , or 
b . .  if the bu i ld ing or work authorized by such permit is suspended or 

abandoned at any time after the work is commenced for a period of six (6) 
months, or 

c. if the work authorized by such permit does not receive final inspection 
approval with in  th ree (3) years from the date the permit was issued,  o r  

d .  if the abatement deadl ine prescribed by the City's Code Enforcement 
section has passed . 

5 



76

Before such work may be recommenced , a new permit wi l l  f i rst be obtained to do 
so . The fee therefore , wi l l  be based upon the extent of work remaining to complete the 
project, but such fee wil l  not exceed one-half the current perm it fee prov id ing no 
changes have been made or will be made in the original  p lan and specifications for such 
work; and provided further that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one 
( 1 ) year. In order to renew action on a perm it after expi ration exceeds one year, the 
permittee wil l  pay a new fu l l  permit fee . When the permittee is unable to perform work 
with in  the time requ ired by this section , for good cause shown , any permittee h o lding an 
unexpired permit may apply for an extension of the t ime with in which the perm ittee may 
perform work under that perm it .  The Bui ld ing Official may, without requ i ring payment of 
an addit ional perm it fee, extend the time for action by the perm ittee for periods not 
exceeding six (6) months u pon written request by the permittee showing that 
circumstances beyond the control of the perm ittee have prevented action from being 
taken.  For purposes of this Section , the time period during which a project is deemed 
suspended or abandoned wil l  be measured as e lapsed time between approved 
REQUI RED I NSPECTIONS as del ineated in th is code. 

1 4. Section R1 08 .5 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R 1 08.5 Fee Refunds.  The Bui ld ing Official may authorize refund ing of a fee paid 
hereunder which was erroneously paid or col lected.  

The Bui lding Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the 
perm it fee when no work has been done under a perm it issued in  accordance with th is 
code. 

The Bui ld ing Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the 
P lan Check Deposit fee paid when an appl ication for a permit for which a plan check 
deposit has been paid is withdrawn or cancel led before any examination time h as been 
expended . 

The Bui lding Official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid ,  except 
upon written appl ication filed by the original permittee not later than 1 80 days after the 
date of the fee payment. 

1 5. Section R 1 08 .7 is added and reads as fol lows: 

R 1 08 .7 Fees. fees wi l l  be as establ ished by city counci l  resolution or ord inance. 
The city counci l wi l l  hold a publ ic hearing upon notice on the resolution or on  any 
proposed amendments thereto . The resolution or any amendment thereto w i l l  take 
effect on the date approved by city counci l  adoption . 

1 6 . Section R1 1 2  is amended to read as fol lows: 

6 
A1 0-00281 



77

R1 1 2 . Local Appeals Board .  A Local Appeals Board (also identified as 
II Board" or " Board of Appeals") is establ ished to hear and decide 
appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the Bui ld ing 
Official or Fire Marshal relative to the appl ication and interpretation of 
the bui ld ing requ i rements of the city. The Board wil l  consist of  seven 
members who wi l l  be appointed by the city counci l . In addit ion ,  the 
Bu i ld ing Official , or his or her designee , wi l l  be an ex-officio member 
and wi l l  act as secretary to the Board . Five of the voting members wil l  
constitute a quorum;  the ex-officio member wi l l  have no vote. Each of 
the voting members wi l l  be qual ified by experience and train ing to 
consider m atters pertain ing to construction regu lations and each wi l l  be 
an actual resident of the City during h is/her incumbency. Whenever 
possible, the Board wi l l  be composed of members represent ing the 
fol lowing specialties: General Contractor, Licensed Professional 
Engineer, Licensed Architect, Handicapped Accessibi l ity Advocate , 
P lanning/Zon ing Professional, Licensed Real Estate Professional . I f  a 
Board member ceases at any time to be an actual resident of the C ity, 
the office held by that member wi l l  be deemed vacant. Of the 
members of the Board f i rst appointed , three wi l l  be appointed for in itial 
terms of fou r  years. Their successors wi l l  be appointed for term s  of 
four  years .  Each member will serve unti l  h is or her successor is 
appointed . The Board wil l adopt reasonable ru les and regulat ions for 
conducting its business and wil l  render al l  decisions and find ings in 
writ ing to the appel lant with a copy to the Bui ld ing Official .  The Board 
may recommend to the city counci l  such new legislation as it may 
deem appropriate . The Local Appeals Board wil l  serve as the 
appellate board or body whenever any of the codes adopted by 
reference provide for same. The Local Appeals Board wil l  also act as 
the Appeals Board for the Earthquake Hazard Reduction Ord inance. 
Appeals to the Board wi l l  be processed in  accordance with 
adm inistrative pol icies and on appl ication forms provided by the 
Bu i ld ing Official . A fee establ ished by c ity counci l  resolut ion wil l  
accompany an application for a hearing before the Board of Appeals.  
Copies of any ru les and regu lations adopted by the Board wi l l  be 
del ivered to the Bu i lding Official , who wi l l  make them freely accessible 
to the publ ic .  The Board of Appeals wi l l  have no authority relative to 
interpretation of the admin istrative p rovisions of this code nor w i ll the 
Board be empowered to waive requ i rements of this code or the 
technical codes. 

1 7 . Section R1 1 5  is added to read as fol lows: 

R 1 1 5  Notice of Non-Compl iance. Whenever the Bui ld ing Official determines that 
work has been done on, over, or in any property in  the City of San Buenave ntura 
without the required perm it , or has otherwise not been completed in accordance with 

7 
A1 0-00281  



78

the State Bu i ld ing Standards as adopted by the City of San Buenaventura,  the Bui ld ing 
Official may record a Notice of Non-Compl iance for the subject property with the County 
Recorder after notifying the subject property owner of record,  in writ ing, at least 30-days 
prior to recording.  The Notice of Non-Compl iance sha l l  describe the property, set forth 
the non-compl iance condit ions, and shal l identify the property owner g iven not ice and 
that owners mai l ing address from the currently avai lab le County tax rol l .  

The Bu i ld ing Official shal l submit a Release of  Non-Compl iance to  the County 
Recorder when it is determ ined that non-compl iant conditions have been completely 
corrected in accordance with the C ity Mun icipal  Code and al l  other Local , State, and 
Federal  regulations .  A fee,  establ ished by C ity Counci l ,  may be charged to the p roperty 
owner for the preparation of the Release of Non-Compl iance document. Payment of 
this fee and all other fees associated with the enforcement case are prerequ is ites to 
del ivery of the Release of Non-Compl iance to the property owner. The Bu i ld ing Official 
may, at h is/her d iscretion , enter into a written agreement with buyers of a N oticed 
property such that a Release of Non-Compl iance is issued for a specific period of t ime 
in order to faci l itate the purchase of the property and abatement of the violat ions.  In 
these situations, payment of al l other fees associated with the enforcement case may 
fol low issuance of the Release of Non-Compl iance . 

1 8 . Section R 1 1 6  is added to read as fol lows: 

R 1 1 6 . Confl icts with other C ity Codes and Ord inances. When a conf l ict exists 
between City P lann ing and Zoning regulations and th is section , the City Plan n in g  and 
Zon ing regulations wi l l  take precedence. 

1 9 . Section R 1 1 7  is added to read as follows: 

R 1 1 7. Fire District .  Fi re-resistive and f ire preventative construction requ i re ments 
specific to development with in the urban wild land interface shall be in accordance with 
the State Fire Code as adopted by the City's Fi re Marshal . 

20. Section R31 3 .2 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R31 3.2 One- and two-fami ly dwel l ing automatic f i re systems. An automatic fire 
sprinkler system shall be instal led in  one- and two-fami ly dwel l ings. 

Exception: For Add itions and alterations to exist ing bu i ld ings see Cal iforn ia  Fire 
Code Section L 1 03.2 

R31 3.2. 1 (Remains as drafted by the State) 

2 1 . Section R401 . 1  is amended to read as fol lows: 

R401 . 1  APPLICATION .  The provisions of th is chapter shal l control the desig n  
and construction of the foundation and foundation spaces for a l l  bui ld ings. I n  add it ion to 

8 
A1 0-00281 



79

the provisions of th is chapter, the design and construction of foundations in areas p rone 
to flooding as established by Table R301 .2 ( 1 ) shal l meet the provisions of Section 
R322 . Wood foundations shal l be designed and instal led in accordance with AF&PA 
PWF. 

EXCEPTION :  The provisions of th is chapter shal l  be perm itted to be used for 
wood foundations only in  the fol lowin g  situations: 

1 .  I n  bu i ldings that have no more than two floors and a roof. 
2.  When interior basement and foundation wal ls  are constructed at in tervals 

not exceeding 50 feet ( 1 5 ,240 mm) . 

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category Do, 01  O2 and E shal l be designed i n  
accordance with accepted engineering practice. 

22. Section R402.3 . 1 .2 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R403. 1 .2 Continuous Footing In  Seismic Design Categories Do, 01 AND O2 • The 
braced wal l panels at exterior wal ls of bu i ld ings located in Seismic Design Categories 
Do, D 1an d  O2 shal l  be supported by continuous footings . Al l  required interior braced wal l  
panels in bu i ld ings shal l  be  supported by  continuous footings. 

23. Section R403. 1 .3 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R403. 1 .3 Seismic Reinforcing . Concrete footings located in Seismic Design 
Categories Do, D 1 and O2 as establ ished in Table R301 .2( 1 ) ,  shal l have min imum 
reinforcement. Bottom reinforcement shal l  be located a m in imum of 3 inches (76 m m )  
clear from the bottom of the footing. 

I n  Seismic Design Categories 00, 0 1 , O2 and E where a construction joint is 
created between a concrete footing and a stem wal l ,  a m in imum of one No.4 bar sha l l  
be instal led at not more than 4 feet ( 1 ,21 9 mm) on center. The vertical bar  shal l  extend 
to 3 inches (76 m m) clear of the bottom of the footing, have a standard hook and extend 
a m in imum of 14 inches (357 mm) into the stem wal l .  

In  Seismic Design Categories Do, 0 1 , O2 and E where a grouted masonry stem 
wal l is supported on a concrete footing and stem wal l ,  a m in imum of one No.4 bar shal l  
be instal led at not more than 4 feet ( 1 ,2 1 9  mm) on center. The vert ical bar shal l extend 
to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the bottom of the footing and have a standard hook. 

In  Seism ic Design Categories 00 , 0 1 , O2 and E masonry stem wal ls without sol id  
grout and vertical reinforcing are not permitted. 

EXCEPTION:  In  detached one- and two-fami ly dwel l ings in Seismic Design 
Categories A, B, and C, which are three stories or less in height and constructed with 
stud bearing wal ls ,  plain concrete footings without longitudinal reinforcement supporting 

9 
A1 0-00281 



80

wal ls and isolated plain concrete footings supporting columns or pedestals are 
perm itted. 

24 . Section R403. 1 .5 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R403. 1 .5 Slope. The top surtace of footings shal l  be level . The bottom surface of 
footings shal l not have a slope exceeding one un it vertical in ten un its horizontal ( 1 0-
percent slope) . Footings shal l  be stepped where it is necessary to change the e levation 
of the top surtace of the footings or where the slope of the bottom surtace of the 
footings wil l  exceed one un it vertical in  ten un its horizontal (1 O-percent slope) . 

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories 00, 01 , 02, and E ,  stepped 
footings shal l be reinforced with four (4) Y2-inch d iameter ( 1 2 .7 m m) deformed 
reinforcing bars .  Two bars shal l  be placed at the top of the footing and two bars shal l  be 
placed at the bottom of the footing. 

25. Section R404.2 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R404.2 WOOD FOU NDATION WALLS. Wood foundation wal ls shall be 
constructed in accordance with the provisions of Sections R404.2 . 1  th rough R404.2 .6  
and with the detai ls shown in Figures 403 . 1 (2) and R403. 1 (3) . Wood foundation wal ls  
shal l not be used for structu res located in Seismic. Design Categories Do, D1 , 02 , and 
E "  

26. Section RB02.B is amended to read as fol lows: 

RB02.B LATERAL SUPPORT. Roof framing members and cei l ing joists having  a 
depth-to-thickness ratio exceeding 2 to 1 based on nominal d imensions shal l be  
provided with lateral support at  points of  bearing to  prevent rotation . For roof rafte rs with 
cei l ing joists attached per Table R602 .3( 1 ) ,  the depth-th ickness ratio for the total 
assembly shall be determined using the combined th ickness of the rafter plus the 
attached cei l ing joist. 

27. Section RB02 . 1 0 .2  is amended to read as follows: 

RB02 . 1 0 .2 Design .  Wood trusses shal l  be designed in accordance with accepted 
engineering practice. The design and manufacture of metal-plate-connected wood 
trusses shal l comply with ANSIITPI 1 .  The truss design drawings shal l be prepared by a 
registered professional .  

2B. Section R902 . 1  is amended to read as fol lows: 

R902 . 1  Roof Covering Materials. Roofs shal l  be covered wit materials as set 
forth in Sections R904 and R905. A m in imum Class B shal l  be installed al l  areas 
designated by th is section.  Roof coverings shall be national ly l isted and tested i n  
accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E 1 0B.  

1 0  
A1 0-00281 



81

Additional roof covering f ire-resistive or  c lassification requ irements as pub l ished 
in the C ity Fire Code shal l supercede the requ i rements of the above paragraph . 

29. Section R902 . 1 . 1 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R902 . 1 . 1  Roof Coverings W ith in Very H igh Fire Hazard Severity Zones. The 
enti re roof covering of every exist ing structure where more than 50 percent of the total 
roof area is replaced with in any one-year period , the enti re roof covering of every new 
structure ,  and any roof covering applied in the addit ion, alteration , repair or replacement 
of the roof of every eXisting structure ,  shal l be a f ire-retardant roof covering that is at 
least C lass A. 

30. Section R902 . 1 .2 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R902 . 1 .2 Roof Coverings With in State Responsib i l ity Areas. The entire roof 
covering of every existing structu re where more than 50 percent of the total roof area is 
replaced within anyone-year period,  the entire roof covering of every new struct u re ,  and 
any roof covering appl ied in the addition , alteration , repair or  rep lacement of the roof of 
every existing structure shal l  be a fi re-retardant roof covering that is at least Class A. 

31 . Section R902 . 1 .3 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R902 . 1 .3 Roof Coverings I n  Al l Other Areas. The enti re roof covering of every 
exist ing structure where more than 50 percent of the total roof area is replaced with in 
any one-year period, the entire roof covering of every new structure ,  and any roof 
covering appl ied in  the add it ion, a lterat ion , repair or replacement of the roof of every 
existing structure, shal l  be a fire-retardant roof covering that is at least Class B. 

32 . Section R902 .2 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R902 .2 Fire-Retardant-Treated Shingles And Shakes. Fire-retardant-treated 
wood shakes and shingles are wood shakes and sh ingles complying with USC 
Standard 1 5-3 or 1 5-4 which are impregnated by the fu l l-cel l  vacuum-pressure process 
with fi re-retardant chemicals, and which have been qualified by USC Standard 1 5-2 for 
use on C lass A, S or C roofs . 

Except as provided in Sections 902. 1 . 1 th rough 902 . 1 .3 ,  f ire-retardant-treated 
wood shakes and sh ingles shal l  not be perm itted . 

33. Section R1 00 1 .3. 1 is amended to read as fol lows: 

R 1 001 .3 . 1 Vertical Reinforcing.  For ch imneys up to 40 inches ( 1 01 6  mm) wide, 
four  No.4 continuous vertical bars shal l be placed between wythes of sol id masonry o r  
within the cells of hollow unit masonry, extended to the bottom th ird of the footing, 
turned a minimum 24 inches horizontal and grouted in accordance with Section R609 . 

1 1  
A1 0-00281 



82

Grout shal l  be prevented from bonding with the f lue l iner so that the f lue l iner is f ree to 
move with thermal expansion . For ch imneys more than 40 inches ( 1 ,0 1 6 mm) wide, two 
additional No .4 vertical bars shal l be provided for each additional flue incorporated into 
the ch imney or for each additional 40 inches ( 1 ,01 6 mm) in width or fraction thereof. 

SECTION 3: CALI FORNIA ENVI RONMENTAL QUALITY ACT EXEMPTION . The city 
counci l  determines that this ord inance is exempt from review under the Cal iforn ia 
Environmental Qual ity Act (Cal iforn ia Publ ic Resou rces Code §§ 2 1 000, et seq. , 
"CEQA") and the regu lations promulgated thereunder ( 1 4 Cal iforn ia Code of 
Regu lations §§ 1 5000, et seq. , the "State CEQA Guidel ines") because it consists only of 
minor revisions and clarifications to an exist ing code of construction-related reg u lations 
and specification of procedures related thereto and wi l l  not have the effect of deleting or 
substantial ly changing any regu latory standards or f indings required therefor .  This 
ordinance, therefore , is an action being taken for enhanced protection of the 
environment and that does not have the potential to cause sign ificant effects on the 
environment. 

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Repeal of any provision of the SBMC or any other city 
ord inance herein wi l l  not affect any penalty, forfeitu re ,  or l iabi l ity incurred b efore ,  or  
preclude prosecution and imposition of penalties for any violation occurring before, the 
effective date of this Ord inance . Any such repealed part wil l remain in ful l fo rce and 
effect for sustaining action or prosecuting violations occurring before the effective date 
of this Ord inance. 
II 
II 

1 2  
A1 0-00281  



83

SECTION 5: EFFECTIVE DATE.  Th is Ord inance wi l l  take effect on the 3 1 st day 
fol lowing its final passage and adoption or January 1 ,  20 1 1  whichever is later. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this _ day of _____ , 20 1 0 . 

ATTEST: 

Mabi Covarrubias Pl isky 
City Clerk 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

Ariel Pie�nne 
City Attorney 

A1 0-00281 

Bi l l  Fulton ,  Mayor 

1 3  


